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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 26 August 2020 9:51 AM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); Admin A
Subject: RE:  AIG REF: GZ 7483Z   LKK REF: CC4/AIG20006604/Kds3 //KURU REF: L.20.0542.PL 

// ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 7483Z , YP 6496H & OTHERS ALONG/ AT SLE BEFORE 
TPE EXIT ON 22/06/2020

Hi LKK, 
 
Insured’s lawyer is checking on claim status. Please revert to them accordingly. 
 
Thanks. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Bernard Ler 
AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120) 
 
Tel +(65) 6419 1946  
 
Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 
 
 
 

From: Kuru & Co [mailto:kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg]  
Sent: 26 August 2020 09:02 
To: Claims Admin Support <ClaimsAdminSupport@aig.com>; Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com> 
Cc: jiaLe@lkkauto.com; lawrence5088@aikchinhin.com 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] AIG REF: GZ 7483Z LKK REF: CC4/AIG20006604/Kds3 //KURU REF: L.20.0542.PL // ACCIDENT 
INVOLVING GZ 7483Z , YP 6496H & OTHERS ALONG/ AT SLE BEFORE TPE EXIT ON 22/06/2020 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Our ref:           L.20.0542.pl 
                        (Please quote or reference when replying)  

Your insured:  GZ 7483Z 

  

26 August 2020                                                           

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd                                                   
78 Shenton Way 
#08-16 AIG Building 
Singapore 079120 
 
Attn: Motor claims department/Bernard Ler 
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Dear Sirs, 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 7483Z, YP 6496H, GX 1519E & GBD 4770P ON 22.6.2020 AT/ALONG 
SLE BEFORE TPE EXIT 

We act for your insured Aik Chin Hin Machinery Co., owner of motor vehicle GZ 7483Z in the above matter.

We are instructed to pursue a common law claim against the Third Party, as such please do not prejudice our 
mutual client’s claim. 

Please advise the status of the third party claim against our mutual client.  If settlement was reached, kindly 
let us know whether the settlement was on a “Without Prejudice” basis and the percentage of liability (if any).

Yours faithfully, 

 
Ms Ting 
Kuru & Co  
150 South Bridge Road 
#04-06 Fook Hai Building 
Singapore 058727 
Tel: 6532 2009  
Fax: 6532 2007 
 
CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended for the addressee(s) only and may contain confidential 
information and/or may be subjected to legal privilege. If you have received in error,  please notify us immediately by return 
email, delete this message and you shall not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained herein.   
 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, 
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please 
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or 
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other 
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of 
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International 
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any 
way from its use. 


