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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Jas Auto <jasautoservices@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 2 January 2021 4:47 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: GBD9780C updates

Attachments: Revised GBD9780C invoice.pdf; GBD9780C signed DV.pdf

Dear Jia Le 

 

Attached signed DV and revised invoice 

Thank you 

 

JAS Auto Services 

 

On Fri, Nov 20, 2020 at 3:22 PM Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with your revised invoice at $6200. 

Thank you. 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 

related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Jas Auto [mailto:jasautoservices@gmail.com]  

Sent: Friday, 20 November 2020 3:11 PM 

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 

Subject: Re: GBD9780C updates 

  

Dear Jia Le 
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Offer accepted. 

Any DV to sign? 

Thank you 

  

JAS Auto Services 

  

  

On Fri, Nov 20, 2020 at 2:44 PM Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

We propose settlement as follows:- 

1. Cost of Repair $ 6,200.00 

2. Loss of Rental (7days x $100) $    700.00 

TOTAL $ 6,900.00 

 Please confirm acceptance. 

 “Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 

this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 

liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 

related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Jas Auto [mailto:jasautoservices@gmail.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 14 October 2020 4:15 PM 

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 

Subject: Re: GBD9780C updates 

  

Dear Jia le 

  

Offer of $6200(COR) accepted. 

Kindly prepare the DV. 

Thank you 

  

JAS Auto Services 

  

On Wed, Oct 7, 2020 at 9:31 AM Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

Our surveyor able to settle at $6200(Max). 

Thank you. 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Jas Auto [mailto:jasautoservices@gmail.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 6 October 2020 9:52 AM 

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 

Subject: Re: GBD9780C updates 

  

Dear Jia Le 

  

Can we settle it at a figure(Cost Of Repair) of $6500? 

Thank you 

  

JAS Auto Services 

  

On Thu, Oct 1, 2020 at 8:34 AM Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

For quick and amicable settlement, our surveyor proposed Cost of Repair at $6000.00. 

Thank you. 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Jas Auto [mailto:jasautoservices@gmail.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 30 September 2020 2:08 PM 



5

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 

Subject: Re: GBD9780C updates 

  

Dear Team 

  

We refer to your email 

  

We regret to inform you that our client has rejected your offer 

In the spirit of amicable settlement, our client is re-proposing the following 

  

Cost of Repair: $7000.00 

  

Kindly let us know soon 

  

Thank you 

  

Jas Auto Services 

  

On Wed, Sep 30, 2020 at 9:37 AM Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

Please liaise with our surveyor on Cost of Repair before we negotiate on settlement as the repair amount is 

not tally with your LOD. 

Thank you. 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

Best Regards, 
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Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Jas Auto [mailto:jasautoservices@gmail.com]  

Sent: Saturday, 26 September 2020 9:59 AM 

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 

Subject: GBD9780C updates 

  

Dear Jia Le 

  

Can i check the progress of GBD9780C 

MSFCIL: D20001149MFSH/SHB2329J DOA 21-02-2020   

Last email, LOD/Final Bill/LOA sent on 2nd July. 

Thank you 

  

Jas Auto Services 


