Elaine (LKK Auto)

To: loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg

Cc: claims@budgetdirect.com.sg; 'SUR’; veronchen@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: OUR REF : 2006-22 // YOUR REF : SKV8397G ACCIDENT INVOLVINGSKV8397G
AND SMH3809T || C10006519

Attachments: AGI-LKKInvoice-AC2005534.pdf; GIA Rpt.pdf; LKK photo.pdf; LKKAdjustment.pdf;

LKKInspection.pdf; Resurvey photo-1.pdf; Resurvey photo-2.pdf

Dear Loganathan,

Enclose Survey Report of SMH 3809T.

Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much

regretted.

Best Regards,

Elaine | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933

From: Loganathan Agoram <loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 13 August 2020 9:21 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>;
SUR <sur@]lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments @lkkauto.com>

Cec: Claims <claims @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OUR REF : 2006-22 // YOUR REF : SKV8397G ACCIDENT INVOLVINGSKV8397G AND
SMH3809T Il C10006519

Dear Veron,
Well noted on your email.

Do let us have the report once its ready.



Thank you
Regards,

Logan
Executive, Claims
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190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore
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auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct
Insurance.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 August 2020 3:27 pm

To: Loganathan Agoram <loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-
d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@]lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments @lkkauto.com>

Cec: Claims <claims @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OUR REF : 2006-22 // YOUR REF : SKV8397G ACCIDENT INVOLVINGSKV8397G AND
SMH3809T Il C10006519

Dear Logan,

We are in the midst of preparing report.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 1 S(408933)



From: Loganathan Agoram <loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 August 2020 3:09 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments

<assignments @lkkauto.com>

Cec: Claims <claims @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OUR REF : 2006-22 // YOUR REF : SKV8397G ACCIDENT INVOLVINGSKV8397G AND
SMH3809T Il C10006519

Importance: High

Hi Nivitha,

We refer to this case which was assigned to LKK previously on 23/06/2020.

Kindly do let us have the survey report as we have already received the LOD from the third party workshop.
Thank you

Regards,

Logan
Executive, Claims
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct
Insurance.

From: Claims <claims @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 June 2020 5:22 pm

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur @lkkauto.com>

Cc: Loganathan Agoram <loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Derrick Quok
<derrick.g@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth.lim @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Fw: OUR REF : 2006-22 // YOUR REF : SKV8397G ACCIDENT INVOLVINGSKV8397G AND
SMH3809T Il C10006519




Hi Team,
We would like to arrange TP PRS for SMH3809T. TP chose Mr. Taufikh to survey this vehicle.

Workshop information:

Darren

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 68442475

Please confirm. Thank you.

Regards,

Ivy Ratilla

Executive, Claims Admin

T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853

Eivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199

Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre

Singapore
239924



budgetdirect.com.sg

From: Darren <claims @teamworkgarage.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 June 2020 16:39

To: Claims <claims @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Loganathan Agoram <loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OUR REF : 2006-22 // YOUR REF : SKV8397G ACCIDENT INVOLVINGSKV8397G AND
SMH3809T Il C10006519

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,
Kindly appoint LKK Taufikh

Darren

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 68442475

Fax: 68442474

From: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 June 2020 17:42

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com>

Subject: OUR REF : 2006-22 // YOUR REF : SKV8397G ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV8397G AND SMH3809T

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

OUR REF : 2006-22
YOUR REF : SKV8397G

Dear Sir / Madam,
PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SMH3809T
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV8397G AND SMH3809T ON 20.06.2020.

We refer to the above matter and enclosed herewith our client’s GIA report and notification of Pre-repair inspection for
your attention.

We also enclosed herewith the State Court of the Republic of Singapore Practice Direction-Amendment No. 1 of 2016 of
2016 of Pre-repair Inspection for your attention.



Thank you and have a nice day.

Regards,

Shu Shan

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1
#01-24

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 6844 2475

Fax:6844 2474
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