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RE: - AIG -OD / 4928067097SG / SME3282C - Request DL, COI, to...

From: claims@premiumauto.com.sg

To: Deeban.Nadaraja@aig.com, sur@lkkauto.com, siewsc@lkkauto.com
Cc: ShengYang.Lim@aig.com, NurMariahHuibrechts.MohdRizal@aig.com
Sent:  24/6/2020 8:56:30 AM

Attachments: "] SME 3282 C 18062020 ADDENDUM GIA.PDF -] Cl & DL.pdf

Dear Deeban,
Sorry for the confusion.
The correct name of policy holder should be " SOMA SAHARAY " and i have done the addendum.

Kindly find the attached addendum GIA, Cl and DL for your reference.

A part from that, we’re checking with owner if there is a copy of private settlement form.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
George Wong

From: Nadaraja, Deeban

Sent: Tue, 23 Jun 2020 09:14:56 +0000

To: SUR, claims@premiumauto.com.sg, 'Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Cc: Lim, Sheng Yang, Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts
Subject: - AIG —OD /4928067097SG / SME3282C - Request DL, COl, to confirm insured's name and private
settlement form.

Dear Team,

Kindly assist to provide drivers driving license and certificate of insurance.

Aside of that, kindly assist to confirm insured name since in our system stated “SOMA SAHARAY* instated
of “SOMA SAHARY”.

Noted that Ol mention in GIA report “THE OTHER PARTY WILL NOT CLAIM AND TO BE SETTLED
PERSONALLY”, kindly assist to confirm is insured doing private settlement with third party? If insured
would like to do private settlement with third party, advice insured fill up the form as per attached for our
review.

Circumstances of Accident

DURING RETURNING FROM OFFICE TO HOME ON NORTH BUONA VISTA ROAD NEAR HOLLAND ROAD CROSSING, APPLIED BRAKES DURING HEAVY RAIN, BUT CAR DID NOT STOP IN TIME AND HIT THE REAR BUMPER OF A STATIONARY CAR IN
FRONT. THE OTHER PARTY WILL NOT CLAIM AND TO BE SETTLED PERSONALLY. NO PERSON WAS INJURED BY THIS INCIDENT.

Thankyou
Best Regards.

Deeban Nadaraja

AlG

Express Claims Adjuster II,

Auto Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
Tel 8001206556 | Ext : 1012793
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IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.



