Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Don Bong Kiong Hua <kionghua.bong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 22 June, 2020 5:16 PM

To: 'motorclaim@iii.com.sg’; Admin A; assignments

Cc: Andre Chow En De; Coco Lu Ting; Edwin Abcede Caina; Kevin Leong Wai Kit
Subject: FW: TP INDIA SDX9128H AGAINTS SHA4645M DOA 22.06.2020
Attachments: [Untitled].pdf

Importance: High

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: HMK

Dear Officer In-Charge,

This email is with regards to the above accident which has been reported by our customer. We have since been
instructed by him/her (motor vehicle number (SDX9128H) to submit a claim on his/her behalf as we are the
authorised repair workshop for his/her car.

We note that you are the insurer (3rd party) of the (motor vehicle number SHA4645M) involved. As such we are
proposing for a Direct Settlement with regards to the repair costs and other consequential losses.

We appreciate your assistance in this matter and look forward to your agreement on this direct settlement.

Do let me know the liability at the soonest possible.

Don Bong

Claim Division Operations
209 Pandan Gardens
Singapore 609339
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DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd
and/or any of its related corporations.



