Su Li (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Request pre-repair inspection for accident involving SJD9954Z and FBM138U on 10
March 2020

From: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 June, 2020 4:37 PM

To: 'Venessa Chan - SGUser' <venessa.chan@fwd.com>; 'admin-a@lkkauto.com'; 'assignments' <assignments@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Motor Claims SG - SG Common' <motorclaims.sg@fwd.com>; 'Elaine Cheong Mei Ling - SGUser' <elaine.cheong@fwd.com>;
'Lionel Tan Tian Pei - SGUser' <lionel.tan@fwd.com>

Subject: RE: Request pre-repair inspection for accident involving SJID9954Z and FBM138U on 10 March 2020

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Venessa Chan - SGUser <venessa.chan@fwd.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 June, 2020 4:04 PM

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com'; 'admin-a@lkkauto.com'

Cc: Motor Claims SG - SG Common <motorclaims.sg@fwd.com>; Elaine Cheong Mei Ling - SGUser <elaine.cheong@fwd.com>; Lionel
Tan Tian Pei - SGUser <lionel.tan@fwd.com>

Subject: Request pre-repair inspection for accident involving SJD9954Z and FBM138U on 10 March 2020

Hi LKK team,

Both vehicle belongs to FWD.

Please note FBM138U is claiming against SJTD9954Z.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Administrative Assistant, Operations

FWD

insurance

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986
E venessa.chan@fwd.com




W  www.fwd.com.sg

Comprehensive coverage for COVID-19

Get cash benefits and up to S$100K sum assured.
100-dly COVOP fOr SE2B. e & Controns sply. Prosctad w9 speciied i by SO

From: Venessa Chan - SGUser

Sent: Monday, 22 June 2020 10:47 am

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com'; '‘admin-a@lkkauto.com'

Cc: Motor Claims SG - SG Common <motorclaims.sg@fwd.com>; Lionel Tan Tian Pei - SGUser <lionel.tan@fwd.com>
Subject: Request pre-repair inspection for accident involving SJD9954Z and FBM138U on 10 March 2020

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please refer to the email below and liaise with TP repairer for PRS.
Please create the case in Merimen.

Kindly assist to upload assignment email & documents into Merimen.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Venessa Chan
Administrative Assistant, Operations

FWD

insurance

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.

6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986
E venessa.chan@fwd.com

W www.fwd.com.sg

Comprehensive coverage for COVID-19

Get cash benefits and up to S$100K sum assured.
100-dly COVOP fOr SS2B. e & Contons mply. Promcrad v 10 speciied s by SO

From: Venessa Chan - SGUser

Sent: Monday, 22 June 2020 10:46 am

To: 'erofia@singnet.com.sg' <erofia@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Motor Claims SG - SG Common <motorclaims.sg@fwd.com>

Subject: Request pre-repair inspection for accident involving SJD9954Z and FBM138U on 10 March 2020

Hi Leel ee,

Thank you for your selection of LKK Auto Consultant.



We will proceed to assign survey.
Thank you.
Best Regards,

Venessa Chan
Administrative Assistant, Operations

FWD

insurance

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.

6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986
E venessa.chan@fwd.com

W www.fwd.com.sg

Comprehensive coverage for COVID-19

Get cash benefits and up to S$100K sum assured.
100-day COVEr fOr SS28. 1o s Controns soy Promscrad o 0 spnciiad fomns by S0

From: Erofia Motor - LeelLee Tan <erofia@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 22 June 2020 10:22 AM

To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common <motorclaims.sg@fwd.com>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Request pre-repair inspection for accident involving SJD9954Z and FBM138U on 10 March 2020

Dear Sir/Madam
Kindly arrange LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Thank you

Regards

LeelLee Tan

Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd
Tel: 67527740

Fax: 67528669

From: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com [mailto:motorclaims.sg@fwd.com]

Sent: 21 June, 2020 12:05 PM

To: erofia@singnet.com.sg

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Request pre-repair inspection for accident involving SJD9954Z and FBM138U on 10 March 2020

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir,

We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single
joint expert:: -



LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
INFINITI APPRAISAL SERVICE

AJAX INSPECTION SERVICES PTE LTD
RT APPRAISAL

o~

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors as
a single joint expert.

If you are not agreeable to any of the above, we would proceed to appoint a surveyor to conduct a pre repair survey.

Best Regards,

Lionel Tan
Senior Executive, Claims

FWD

insurance

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.

6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986
T  (65)6914 6824

E lionel.tan@fwd.com

W  www.fwd.com.sg

From: Erofia Motor - LeeLee Tan <erofia@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 20 June 2020 12:20 PM

To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common <motorclaims.sg@fwd.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Request pre-repair inspection for accident involving SJID9954Z and FBM138U on 10 March 2020

Dear Sir/Mdm

With reference to the above mentioned, attached necessary documents for your arrangement of pre-repair inspection for our
client’s

Motorcycle No: FBM138U
Workshop:

Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-62
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Tel: 67527740

Thank you

Regards

LeeLee Tan

Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd

Tel: 67527740
Fax: 67528669

ATTENTION:



The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of
the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the
sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose,
copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or
entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete this
email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.
Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any attachments at your
own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT been scanned for viruses by our mail
domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.



