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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 2 July 2020 11:40 AM
To: ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg; jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Your ref: SMS 5431C / LKK ref : CC4/III20006470/Aba3 / Accident involving SMS 

5431C and SLQ 7732T  on the 28/03/2020. 
Attachments: SLQ 7732T.JPG

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
We have our principal ‘s instructions to propose 50% on the liability due to conflicting version. Our insured 
driver report that both vehicle are reversing at the same time and collided. Your client  report that he remain 
in stationary mode, while insured were reverse and hit him. There is no conclusive evidence yet to 
substantiate either party’s version. Enclosed here with in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report 
for your perusal. 
 
Kindly forward to us the video footage or any evidences from your client to support your claim. 
 
Thanks. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Friday, 26 June 2020 9:04 AM 
To: ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg; jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Your ref: SMS 5431C / LKK ref : CC4/III20006470/Aba3 / Accident involving SMS 5431C and SLQ 7732T on 
the 28/03/2020.  
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
We are currently pending liability approval from III. 
 
Will updates once done. 
 
Thanks  
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


