Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: info@ktauto.com.sg
Sent: Thursday, 7 January 2021 12:14 PM
To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: [@&: Fwd:ESTIMATE FOR GBE8100S
Attachments: 8100-dv.pdf
Dear Jaslin,

Please find attached as per request.

Yours faithfully

Wendy Siew

On and behalf of

Kian Teong Auto Centre
176 Sin Ming Drive

Sin Ming autocare #01-08
Singapore 575721

Tel: 65 64556268

Fax: 65 64555166

HP: 91786498
Website:www.ktauto.com.sg

From: "Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)" <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>
Sent: 1/5/21 4:05 PM

To: "info@ktauto.com.sg" <info@ktauto.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: B & : Fwd:ESTIMATE FOR GBE8100S
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for acceptance.

Please duly sign the Release Voucher enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,



Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: info@ktauto.com.sg <info@ktauto.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 5 January 2021 3:36 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: B £: FWd:ESTIMATE FOR GBE8100S

Dear Jaslin,

Please close case as per your finisation.

Yours faithfully

Wendy Siew

On and behalf of

Kian Teong Auto Centre
176 Sin Ming Drive

Sin Ming autocare #01-08
Singapore 575721

Tel: 65 64556268

Fax: 65 64555166

HP: 91786498
Website:www.ktauto.com.sg

From: "Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)" <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: 12/30/20 3:50 PM

To: "info@ktauto.com.sq" <info@ktauto.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [ § : Fwd:ESTIMATE FOR GBE8100S

Your Ref: GBE 8100S
LKK Ref: CC4/A1G20006424/Gra3 Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 1498Z AND GBE 8100S ON 13/06/2020



We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $1,230.50
2. Loss of Use (3 days x $60.00) $180.00
Total | $1,410.50

Please confirm acceptance.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: info@ktauto.com.sg [mailto:info@ktauto.com.sg]
Sent: Saturday, 26 September 2020 10:19 AM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: [A]&: Fwd:ESTIMATE FOR GBE8100S

Dear Chan

Please find attached LOD for your kind processing.

Yours faithfully

Wendy Siew

On and behalf of

Kian Teong Auto Centre
176 Sin Ming Drive

Sin Ming autocare #01-08
Singapore 575721

Tel: 65 64556268

Fax: 65 64555166

HP: 91786498
Website:www.ktauto.com.sg

From: "Jia Le (LKK Auto)" <JiaLe@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: 9/2/20 11:16 AM

To: "info@ktauto.com.sq" <info@ktauto.com.sg>, "Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)" <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: [1| 2 : Fwd:ESTIMATE FOR GBE8100S

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Wendy,

Please send the LOD to us directly.



Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in

softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: info@ktauto.com.sg [mailto:info@ktauto.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 2 September 2020 11:03 AM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Cc: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: [A]&: Fwd:ESTIMATE FOR GBE8100S

Dear Guogiang,

Please close as per your offer and advice LOD to be sent over to LKK or direct to insurance.

Thank you & Best Regards

Wendy Siew

On and Behalf on Kian Teong Auto Centre
Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive

Sin Ming Autocare #01-08/02

Singapore 575721

Tel:64556268

Fax: 64555166



HP: 91786498

Website:www.ktauto.com.sg

From: "Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)" <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>
Sent: 7/3/20 1:50 PM

To: "info@ktauto.com.sq" <info@ktauto.com.sg>

Cc: "Jia Le (LKK Auto)" <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [F|&: Fwd:ESTIMATE FOR GBE8100S

Hi Wendy,

Finalize COR $1150 before GST @ 3 working days.

Regards,
Guo Qiang

A4 A info@ktauto.com.sqg <info@ktauto.com.sg>
RIERT []: 202046129 H 09:20

BefE A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>
X /: Fwd:ESTIMATE FOR GBE8100S

From: admin@ktauto.com.sg

Sent: 6/29/20 9:17 AM

To: info@ktauto.com.sg

Subject: Scan Data from [FXE4417F]




