
1

Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 March, 2017 7:15 PM

To: Ahmad, Syaza

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: AIG Ref: 2860214084SG

Attachments: Video.mov

Dear Syaza, 

 

We refer further to your below email. 

 

Please be informed that we had settled to TP at a global sum basis @ 80% liability in favour of their client on 

31/03/2016 and also to the enclosed TP CCTV Footage. 

 

However, till date, we haven’t received the LOD from TP. 

 

As such, in view of TP inactivity, we will proceed to temporarily close the matter and submit our WP report in 

merimen. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the 

sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden. 

 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 18 August, 2016 11:14 AM 

To: 'hai-chuan.ng@aig.com' <hai-chuan.ng@aig.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Ahmad, Syaza (Syaza.Ahmad@aig.com) <Syaza.Ahmad@aig.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: AIG Ref: 2860214084SG 

 
Dear Mr Ng, 

 

Received with thanks. 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

FYNA. CC3/AIG15019092/Khg3 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Ng, Hai-Chuan [mailto:Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 18 August, 2016 10:51 AM 
To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Ahmad, Syaza 
Subject: AIG Ref: 2860214084SG 

 
Dear both, 

 

Video footage from TP for your necessary action. 

 

Regards, 

 

 

Ng Hai Chuan 

AIG 

Senior Complex Claims Examiner 

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 

 

78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120 

 

Tel +(65)6419 1994| Fax +68357416  

 

Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 

 

IMPORTANT NOTICE: 

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential.  If you are not the intended 

recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information.  If you have received this email in error, 

please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies 

or printouts thereof.  Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or 

other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the 

responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG for 

any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 
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