






NO. CODE DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

1. 6050101 REPAIR-SHB7829A;DOA 24.04.15(LUMP SUM-15) 1 17,869.00 17,869.00

Total SGD Excl. GST : 16,700.00
7% GST : 1,169.00

**** SEVENTEEN THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED SIXTY NINE SGD ONLY **** Total SGD Incl. GST : 17,869.00

1) All cheques should be crossed and made payable to"Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd"
2) Please quote our Invoice Number during payment.
3) We reserve the right to charge interest @ 1.5% per month on overdue invoice.
4) Any dispute as to the accuracy, charges etc of this invoice must be communicated within 10 days from the date hereof failing which it shall be 
deemed to have been unconditionally accepted.

E. & O. E.
THIS IS A COMPUTER GENERATED INVOICE WHICH REQUIRES NO SIGNATURE
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Manivel Priyadarshini <manivel@iii.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 13 July 2020 11:08 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: FW: India ref: MCP141000/01/MP-PODS III Ref: MPRE0003 // LKK Ref: 

CC3/III15007251/K1pa3s2-1 [Accident on 24.04.2015 involving SHD1200S (India) 
and SHB7829A (TP) along/at Upper Thomson Road]

Attachments: EMAIL TO III_Temporary Close File dd 010317.pdf; TP LOD(SHB7829A).pdf; 
SHB7829A DOA 24.04.15.wmv; LKK Survey Report & Photos.pdf

Dear Hsiao, 
 
We refer to your below email, 
 
We are agreeable to the below mandate. 
 
Liability: 100% (Based on 3rd party video: 3rd party was driving straight & suddenly there is an impact on 3rd party 
vehicle.) 
 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $17,869.00 
2. Loss of Rental (14days x $113.42) $  1,587.88 

Total $19,456.88 
 
Thank You 
Best Regards, 
Priya Manivel 
Motor  & Work  Injury Claims Department 
India International Insurance Pte Ltd 
64 Cecil Street, #04/#05 IOB Building, Singapore 049711  
Tel:63476100,Ext-284 
  

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Monday, 6 July 2020 11:31 am 
To: Manivel Priyadarshini <manivel@iii.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: PODS III Ref: MPRE0003 // LKK Ref: CC3/III15007251/K1pa3s2-1 [Accident on 24.04.2015 involving 
SHD1200S (India) and SHB7829A (TP) along/at Upper Thomson Road] 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have temporary close our file on year 2017 due to no submission of LOD/documents from third party. 
 
Now, third party had submitted the LOD, documents & video footage as attached. 
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In view of this, kindly assist to re-open the case and let us have you mandate to settle the matter at $19,456.88(all-
in). Breakdown as follows: - 
 
Liability: 100% (Based on 3rd party video: 3rd party was driving straight & suddenly there is an impact on 3rd party 
vehicle.) 
 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $17,869.00 
2. Loss of Rental (14days x $113.42) $  1,587.88 

Total $19,456.88 
 
*12 recommendation repair days + 1Sunday + 1PRS = 14days 
 
Kindly let us have your mandate/ instruction. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. It may contain confidential and/or 
legally privileged information. If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has 
reached you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby notified that any 
use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination of this information in any way or in any manner is 
strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as 
information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses. Therefore, we do not accept liability 
for any errors or omissions in the content of this message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of 
Internet transmission or any modification.  


