Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 1 March, 2017 11:18 AM

To: ‘Manivel Priyadarshini’

Cc: Zayyer (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: PODS I Ref: MPREOOO3 LKK Ref: CC3/1115007251/K1wa3 Accident on

24.04.2015 involving SHD1200S (India) and SHB7829A (TP) along/at Upper
Thomson Road

ODS 111 Ref: MPRE0003 LKK Ref: CC3MI115007251/K1wa3 _Accident on 24,04.2015 involving
SHD1200S (India) and SHB7829A (TP) along/at Upper Thomson Road

Dear Priva,
We refer to the above matter.
Be informed that till date TP’s repairer had finalised with our surveyor since 28/04/2015 after inspection .

TP’s repairer did not submit the LOD until now. In view of no further development, we will proceed to temporary
close the file and submit the report to your office.

If any new development in future, we will keep you informed for an update and follow up the matter accordingly.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Caze Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlan@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4 o8

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Michelle Lum Kar Mun [mailto:michellelum@iii.com.sg]

Sent; Thursday, 11 June, 2015 2:17 PM

To: Vivian Lau <vivianlau@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: Thin Thin <thinthin@lkkauto.com=; Olivia Lau <clivialau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PODS Il Ref: MPREOOO3 LKK Ref: CC3/1115007251/K1wa3 Accident on 24.04.2015 involving SHD12005
(India) and SHB7829A (TP) along/at Upper Thomson Road

Dear Vivian,
We refer to your email below dated 9 June 2015.
Liability : __50%  (e.g. 50% or 100%)

Officer-In-Charge Mandate : __Agree___ (e.g. agree or disagree)



Remarks : BOLA 19 — basing on the photos given by SHD12005. Both vehicles should exercise caution when changing
lanes.

We are agreeable to a DIRECT SETTLEMENT in this matter.

Please proceed to handle this case under Express settlement and seek mandate from us on quantum in due course.

Best Regards,

Michelle Lum

Mator Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecil Street #04,/#05 108 Building
Singapore 049711

Tel : 6347 6100 [ext. 217) Fax : 62244174
E-mail: michellelum@iii.com.sg

Co. Reg MNo: 198703792K

From: Roger Yap On Behalf Of Motor Claim - il

Sent: Tuesday, 9 June, 2015 6:18 PM

To: Vivian Lau; Michelle Lum Kar Mun

Ce: Thin Thin; Olivia Lau

Subject: RE: PODS Il Ref: MPREOOO3 LKK Ref: CC3/11115007251/K1wa3 Accident on 24.04.2015 invalving SHD12005
(India) and SHB7829A (TP) along/at Upper Thomson Road

Hi Vivian,
This claim is currently handled by Ms Michelle.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Roger Yap

Motor Claim Dept.

india International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street

OB Building #05-00

Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100 Ext: 248

From: Vivian Lau [mailto:vivianlau@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 9 June, 2015 5:54 PM

To: Motar Claim - 1l

Cc: Thin Thin; Olivia Lau

Subject: RE: PODS Il Ref: MPREOOO3 LKK Ref: CC3/11115007251/K1wa3 Accident on 24.04.2015 involving SHD12005
{India) and SHB7829A (TP) along/at Upper Thomson Road

PODS — Express Settlements

PODS Il Ref: MPREOOO3 LKK Ref: CC3/11115007251/K1wa3 Accident on 24.04.2015 involving SHD12005 (India) and
SHB7829A (TP) along/at Upper Thomson Road.




Dear Sir/Madam,

We advise liability as follows for Direct Settlement:

Liability : __50% _(e.g. 50% or 100%)

Officer-in-Charge Mandate : __Agree (e.g. agree or disagree)

Remarks : BOLA 19 — basing on the photos given by SHD12005. Both vehicles should exercise caution when changing
lanes.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Erom: Johnson Chua - Il [mailto:johnson@iii.com.sg

Sent: Tuesday, 12 May, 2015 3:50 PM

To: Olivia Lau; Vivian Lau

Subject: PODS |11 Ref: MPREODO3 LKK Ref; CC3/11115007251/K1wa3 Accident on 24.04.2015 involving SHD12005
(India) and SHB7829A (TP) along/at Upper Thomson Road

Dear LKK,
Please view the accident scene photos and advise liability.

Johnson Chua

Motor Claim Department

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street #04-02 |0OB Building
Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6128 Fax: 6224 4174

From: Goh Wee Dek [mailto:weedek goh@premiertaxi.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 12 May, 2015 3:43 PM

To: Johnson Chua - Il

Cc: Vivian Lau; Gary Shi

Subject: RE: PODS IIl Ref: MPREOOO3 LKK Ref: CC3/11115007251/K1wa3 Accident on 24.04.2015 involving SHD12005
(India) and SHB7829A (TP) along/at Upper Thomson Road

Dear Johnson

First Capital did not appoint surveyor to conduct survey, we are waiting for our panel surveyor to raise the report to
submit claim.

Please refer to attach on the site photos



Regards

Goh Wee Dek
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

pddress: 23 Changl South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 070 | DID: 6544 6689 | Fax: 6214 1511
Visit us at: www.premiertaxi.com

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended
recipient(s) and may contain confidential or proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or
distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact the sender by reply e-mail and
destroy all copies of the original message.

g Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION

#h

From: Johnson Chua - |1l [mailto:johnson@iii.com.sg]

sent: Tuesday, 12 May, 2015 1:59 PM

To: Goh Wee Dek; Gary Shi

Cc: Vivian Lau

Subject: PODS Ill Ref: MPREOOD3 LKK Ref: CC3/11115007251/K1wa3 Accident on 24.04.2015 involving SHD12005
(India) and SHB7829A (TP) along/at Upper Thomson Road

Importance: High

Dear Premier Taxi,

Please update us on your recovery status by 15.05.2015 (Fri). Otherwise, we will proceed to handle the TPD claim at
best.

Johnson Chua

Motor Claim Department

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street #04-02 10B Building
Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6128 Fax: 6224 4174

From: Vivian Lau [mailto:vivianlau@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 12 May, 2015 11:46 AM

To: Johnson Chua - 111

Ce: Thin Thin; Motor Claim - 11l; Mei Kwan (LKK Auto); Olivia Lau; Bryan Ang

Subject: RE: PODS Il Ref: MPREOOO3 LKK Ref: CC3/11115007251/K1wa3 Accident on 24.04.2015 involving SHD12005
lIndia) and SHB7829A (TP) along/at Upper Thomson Road

PODS - Express Settlements

PODS Il Ref: MPREODO3 LKK Ref: §C§£III15ﬂﬂ?251.{Kiwaa Accident on 24.04.2015 involving SHD12005 {India) and
SHB7829A (TP) along/at Upper Thomson Road.

Dear Mr Johnson
We advise liability as follows for Direct Settlement:
Liability : __50% _ (e.g. 50% or 100%)

Officer-in-Charge Mandate : (e.g. agree or disagree)

i



Remarks : BOLA NIL — conflicting version.

TP reported Ol collided onto TP's rear portion, due to the impact TP collided another vehicle in front ( GX 1284G)

0l reported he checked on clearance on lane 4, left indicator on. In the mist of filtering into lane 4, Ol felt an impact
from the left. TP which was on the lane 5 encroached and cut into Ol's lane.

We will review if TP provide evidence.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@|kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Roger Yap [mailto:Roger @iii.com.sg] On Behalf Of Motor Claim - il

Sent: Thursday, 30 April, 2015 10:48 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto); Johnson Chua - Il

Cc: KKLau; Vivian Lau; Thin Thin

Subject: RE: PODS IIl Ref: MPREQDO3 LKK Ref: CC3/1115007251/K1wa3 Accident on 24.04.2015 involving SHD12005
(India) and SHB7829A (TP) along/at Upper Thomson Road

Hi Mei Kuan,

We refer to your email below dated .

We attach copy of our driver's SAS report as requested.
Kindly note that the claim handler is Mr Johnson Chua.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Roger Yap

Motor Claim Dept.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd

From: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 30 April, 2015 10:36 AM

To: Motor Claim - 11l

Cc: KKLau: Vivian Lau; Thin Thin

Subject: PODS |Il Ref: (TBA) LKK Ref: CC3/11115007251/K1wa3 Accident on 24.04.2015 involving SHD12005 (India)
and SHB78294 (TP} along/at Upper Thomson Road

PODS - Express Settlements

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,



\We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHB 7829A at M/s Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd -
Sungei Kadut.

Enclosed herewith a copy of TP's SAS report, police report, estimated cost of repair and photographs of TP vehicle in
its damaged condition for your perusal.

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair is SB4,349.28.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 62563561 | email: MeiKwan@Ilkkauto.com | fax:
67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408533)

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended. or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission. printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K
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