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FW: LOD : [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB 7897Z (OI :
CTI - TBA) and SHC 7883L (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI20006348/T1es3) on 11/06/2020

Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sat 10/3/2020 9:55 PM
To:  Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

7 attachments (2 MB)
LKK RESURVEY PHOTO 1.pdf; LKK RESURVEY PHOTO.pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; LKK ADJUSTMENT.pdf; LKK INSPECTION.pdf; TP
LOD.pdf; LETTER TO OI.pdf;

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
 
Dear Sir/Mdm,
 
We refer to the above cap�oned ma�er and your email below.
 
Please proceed as per your proposal;
 

 
Regards,
 
Irene Tay
Executive
Claims Department (Motor Division)
 

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: (65) 63896192   |   F:(65) 62247478/62247175
  
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify

the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

 
 
 

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Sent: Monday, September 28, 2020 4:24 PM
To: Angie Foo <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: LOD : [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: Direct Se�lement - Accident Involving GBB 7897Z (OI : CTI - TBA) and SHC 7883L
(TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI20006348/T1es3) on 11/06/2020
 
 

http://www.sg.cntaiping.com/
http://www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/
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From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Sunday, September 27, 2020 1:44 PM
To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: Direct Se�lement - Accident Involving GBB 7897Z (OI : CTI - TBA) and SHC 7883L (TP :
LKK REF - CC3/CTI20006348/T1es3) on 11/06/2020
 

Your ref : SNM20D202108

Our ref : CC3/CTI20006348/T1es3n2

 

Dear Sirs,

 

We refer to the above matter.

 

The accident occurred when our insured exit from the parking lot and hit third party parked vehicle. We are of
the opinion that liability is not in our insured’s favour.

 

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

 

We seek your approval to offer repairer "COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD" at $4,662.87 (all-in).

 

The summary is as follows: -

 

  Amount Claimed Amount Revised  

1. Cost of Repairs (with GST) $   5,011.58 $   4,129.81  

2. Loss of Rental (3days x $125.19) $      375.57 $       375.57 (3days x $125.19)

3. Loss of Income (3days x $80) $      240.00 $       150.00 (3days x $50)

3. LTA Search Fee $           7.49 $            7.49  

Total $   5,634.64 $    4,662.87  

 

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

 

mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com
mailto:irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
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For your approval please.

 
 
Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 
 

From: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Sunday, July 12, 2020 12:02 PM
To: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Se�lement - Accident Involving GBB 7897Z (OI : CTI - TBA) and SHC 7883L (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI20006348/T1es3) on 11/06/2020
 
Enclosed herewith the GIA REPORT as requested by you.
 
Regards,
 
Irene Tay
Executive
Claims Department (Motor Division)
 

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: (65) 63896192   |   F:(65) 62247478/62247175
  
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify

the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

 
 
 

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, June 17, 2020 11:02 AM
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Direct Se�lement - Accident Involving GBB 7897Z (OI : CTI - TBA) and SHC 7883L (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI20006348/T1es3) on 11/06/2020
 
Dear Sir / Madam,
 
We refer to the above ma�er.
 
We have inspected third party vehicle SHC 7883L at M/s COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct se�lement.

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
mailto:irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:suli@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com
https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.sg.cntaiping.com%2F&data=02%7C01%7Cclaimsdept%40sg.cntaiping.com%7Ca0f1411039904a0e391f08d862a86a52%7C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%7C0%7C0%7C637367823184049010&sdata=3uENY0GDvSo%2Fbd20Iajh6W1P%2BOgHmQt9oxm%2FwNhuMQs%3D&reserved=0
https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.facebook.com%2Fchinataipingsg%2F&data=02%7C01%7Cclaimsdept%40sg.cntaiping.com%7Ca0f1411039904a0e391f08d862a86a52%7C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%7C0%7C0%7C637367823184049010&sdata=syjud4TAtH377isz175TZmFxXti%2FwNPZrXjEeDCE1Rs%3D&reserved=0
mailto:suli@lkkauto.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com
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Enclosed for your perusal is:
-              TP es�mated cost of repair
-              TP GIA report
-              Preliminary advice
 
Meanwhile, kindly provide us the claim reference number and a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary
ac�on.
 
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher.
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
 
 
* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
                                                              
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li | Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6261 5037 Email: SuLi@lkkauto.com| Fax : 6271 8802

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Branch : Blk 1007, Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-11 | S(159721)

 

mailto:SuLi@lkkauto.com%7C

