Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Josey Loh Kah Wai - SGUser <josey.loh@fwd.com>

Sent: Friday, 25 September 2020 12:25 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Motor Claims SG - SG Common; Eileen Bay - SGUser

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : SKL1212E Claiming T/party
vehicle SDL6883T DOA: 22.05.2020 (Our Ref: 1202000017968) *** LKK REF:
CC4/FWD20006347/Kga3

Hi Cecilia,

We have recovered 100% against TP insurer for OD claim.
Please proceed to reject TP claim.
Thank you.

Kind Regards

Josey Loh
Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

E josey.loh@fwd.com
W  fwd.com.sg

4

insurance

Comprehensive coverage for COVID-19

Get cash benefits and up to $$100K sum assured.
100-day cover for SE28. e s Comsron sy Proseced wo 1o spectad fons by S0C.

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, August 31, 2020 5:19 PM

To: Josey Loh Kah Wai - SGUser <josey.loh@fwd.com>

Cc: Motor Claims SG - SG Common <motorclaims.sg@fwd.com>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : SKL1212E Claiming T/party vehicle SDL6883T DOA: 22.05.2020 (Our
Ref: 1202000017968) *** LKK REF: CC4/FWD20006347/Kga3

Dear Josey,

Yes. Am requesting video footage from TP as well.



Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Saturday, 26 September 2020 2:39 PM

To: ‘enquiry’

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKL 1212E (OUR REF: CC4/FWD20006347/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SDL 6883T & SKL 1212E ON 22/06/2020 ***

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Our Insured has successfully recover 100% from your client’s insurer.

In view of above, we have our principal’s instruction to deny liability and not able to look into this matter.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
57424

RERER WWTT Suve the Larth Print only when necessary:

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 31 August 2020 5:19 PM

To: enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Subject: YOUR REF: SKL 1212E (OUR REF: CC4/FWD20006347/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDL 6883T & SKL 1212E
ON 22/06/2020 ***

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm,



