Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 June 2020 4:15 PM

To: claims@kkimhin.com.sg

Cc: Margaret KKH; Admin A

Subject: RE: O/REF: 150056/01, Y/REF:CC6/AXA15001557/Kba3q2 - ACC INVLG SKF6321Y

ON 25 JAN 2015

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your email.

We propose a settlement at a global sum of $2,950.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: claims@kkimhin.com.sg <claims@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 June 2020 10:40 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Margaret KKH <margaret@kkimhin.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: O/REF: 150056/01, Y/REF:CC6/AXA15001557/Kba3qg2 - ACC INVLG SKF6321Y ON 25 JAN 2015

Dear Jasper

Please assist to look into this outstanding case and let us have your reply soon.

OUR VEH OUR REF DOA YR VEH YR REF LOD DATE REMARKS
SKF6321Y 150056/01 25/01/15 SJQ8835Y X;A 15/10/17 g?fg‘:ing ?CG/AXA15OO1557/Kba3q2'

Thank you.

Best Regards

Carin

K.Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Dr #02-20



Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722
Tel: 6452 7018

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, June 23, 2020 10:07 AM

To: claims@kkimhin.com.sg ; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) ; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Margaret KKH ; Admin A

Subject: RE: LONG OUTSTANDING CASE - (YR 2014 - 2015)

Dear Carin,
FYI please.
SDU6118Y | 140110/02 | 21/2/2014 | $IG227H TA;)(A 16/8/2016 g?f’;fing CC6/AXAL7008573/Kpb3 :';i:go
SKP3515Y | 150048/01 | 21/1/2015 | Gz1493) E:(A 5/10/2017 g?f’;?ing CC6/AXAL5001298/Kpa3s2-1 :isi:go
SKF6321Y | 150056/01 | 25/1/2015 | 108835y |, | 15/10/2017 offor CC6/AXA15001557/Kba3q2-1 Jasper
YM3069T | 150155/03 | 6/3/2015 | SIT2716G TAE’(A 5/10/2017 g‘fefg‘:ing CC6/AXAL5004834/Kpb3q2-1 :‘;i:‘g(’

Hi Hsiao Tong/ Jasper,
Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

From: claims@kkimhin.com.sg <claims@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 June, 2020 3:46 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Christopher Chionh' <chris.chionhhs@axa.com.sg>; Margaret KKH <margaret@kkimhin.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong
(LKKAuto) <chewht@I|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: LONG OUTSTANDING CASE - (YR 2014 - 2015)

Dear Mei Kwan
With reference to our email dated 2 Jun 2020.
Please advise are docs all in order ?

Please let us know should you require more doc, look forward to your settlement soon.



