
Date:

LKK Ref:
Your Vehicle:
Our Vehicle:

SHC8138Z & on

We act on behalf of our Client, Vehicle No.

: 2,140.00$        (incl. GST)
: 270.00$           
: 7.45$                

: 2,417.45$        

CC4/FCI20006337/da3
SHC8138Z

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
36 ROBINSON ROAD
#16-01 CITY HOUSE
SINGAPORE 068877
Attn: Motor Claims Department

Total

Kindly revert back to us within 7 working days from date of above if you wish to settle with us under direct settlement.

People's Vehicle Recovery Service
Yours Sincerely,

Thank you.

LTA Search

SGU3161E

COR (as per your appointed surveyor)

Re: Accident involving 10/6/2020

on above claim.

SGU3161E

SGU3161E

Loss of use (S$90 x 3 days)

PEOPLE’S VEHICLE RECOVERY SERVICE
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-60 Singapore 408717

Tel: 6743 3246 | Fax: 6743 0013

GST Registration No.: M90001895E

E-mail: peoplevehicle@gmail.com 

LETTER OF DEMAND

21/7/2020

People's Vehicle Recovery Service

This is a computer generated document, no signature is required.



LETTER OF AUTHORITY 

Date: I 06 lam 

To: 

iv6 'tie( occilak 1nsttakiltt ltok 

Attn: Motor Claims Department 

Your Reference: 

Our Reference: 

SIAC, $13S 2-

SestA 316kt 

Re: Accident involving Vehicle no.  SRC 81;82.  and  Shill 3Ih E  on  10 1 ob laiao  . 

I/We  t16\ Um VA put in place 

People's Vehicle Recovery Service so act for me/us with respect to my/our above claim of repair 

costs, rental/loss of use for my/our vehicle no.  SEW AVE 

Kindly issue cheque directly to People's Vehicle Recovery Service for the above claim. 

Yours Faithfully 

Signed By 

Name: MI Clan Soon 

UEN / Last 4 Digit NRIC No.: S Ob961 



MS FlrstCapItaI
MS First Capital Insurance Limited Co.Reg. No. 1950001060 GST Reg. No. M2-0001676-9 

6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580 
Tel: (65) 6222 2311 Fax: (65) 6222 3547 

Claims & Motor Underwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 
Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax: (65) 6507 3849 
wvvw.msfirstcapitaLcom.sg 

DISCHARGE RECEIPT 

CLAIM REFERENCE : D20002407MFSH/1 

ACCIDENT DATE : 10/06/2020 

ACCIDENT LOCATION : TAMPINES AVE 10 TWDS TAMPINES AVE 1 

INSURED : COMFORT TRANSPOTATION PTE LTD 

INSURED DRIVER : STEPHEN YONG CHOON SENG 

INSURED VEHICLE : SHC 8138Z 

INVOLVED PARTY : SGU 3161E 

SETTLEMENT SUM : $ 2,417A5 

I/VVe, the undernoted CLAIMANT being the person/entity entitled to receive the compensation in relation to the accident, 

hereby agree to accept the SETTLEMENT SUM as full and final settlement of all claims for damages, costs & 

disbursements arising out of the ACCIDENT, and I/WE also agree that the said settlement sum: 

1. is paid without admission of liability on the part of MS First Capital Insurance Limited and/or its 
INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER in respect of the said loss and for damage whether 
now or hereafter to become manifest, 

2. is accepted by me/us to the intent that the said MS First Capital Insurance Limited and /or its 
INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER be absolutely and finally discharged from all claims 
whatsoever which INVE now or hereafter may have arising out of or connected with or 
traceable to the said accident. 

IANE acknowledge that this DISCHARGE RECEIPT is not to be construed as an admission of liability on the part of MS 
First Capital Insurance Limited and/or its INSURED and /or its INSURED DRIVER and it shall not be used as evidence 
in any claims or actions which may be made against them or any of them. 

Signature and Date: V4 € CLAIMANT: NO LIAN SOON 

WITNESS : POL,Noifte) Signature and Date: aivi ale op 

A Member of MS&AU INSURANCE GROUP 
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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Sent: Monday, 24 August 2020 4:48 PM
To: Rachel Wu
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE ON QUANTUM [Express Settlement via LKK] - 

D20002407MFSH/1 //  Our ref: CC4/FCI20006337/Ada3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
SHC8138Z AND SGU3161E ON 10/06/2020]

Attachments: LETTER OF DEMAND.pdf

Dear Rachel, 
 
Please be informed that third party claiming the LOU should be $90/day. The previous LOD is wrong due to typo 
error and they had revised the LOD. No change for final settlement amount.  
 
Thank you. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Rachel Wu [mailto:RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg]  
Sent: Friday, 21 August 2020 10:53 AM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: Admin A 
Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE ON QUANTUM [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20002407MFSH/1 // 
Our ref: CC4/FCI20006337/Ada3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC8138Z AND SGU3161E ON 
10/06/2020] 
 
Dear Jia Le, 
 
Please proceed as per your recommendation at $2,417.45. 

- Kindly request letter of authorization from third party. 
 
Thank you 
 
Best Regards 
 
Rachel Wu 
Motor Claim Department 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3862 
|  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
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Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, August 21, 2020 10:38 AM 
To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE ON QUANTUM [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20002407MFSH/1 // 
Our ref: CC4/FCI20006337/Ada3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC8138Z AND SGU3161E ON 
10/06/2020] 
 
Dear Rachel, 
 
We refer to the below email dated on 06/08/2020. 
 
Kindly let us have your mandate approval/instruction. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Thursday, 6 August 2020 2:04 PM 
To: Rachel Wu 
Cc: Admin A 
Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE ON QUANTUM [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20002407MFSH/1 // 
Our ref: CC4/FCI20006337/Ada3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC8138Z AND SGU3161E ON 
10/06/2020] 
 
Claim No: D20002407MFSH/1 
LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20006337/Ada3 
 
Dear Sirs/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 8138Z AND SGU 3161E ON 10/06/2020 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer “PEOPLE’S VEHICLE RECOVERY SERVICE” at $2,417.45(all-in). 
 
The summary is as follows:- 
 

 Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
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1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 4,654.45 $ 2,140.00 
2. Loss of Use (3days x $80) $     270.00 $     270.00   
3. LTA Search Fee $         7.45 $         7.45 
                                                                             Total $ 4,931.90 $ 2,417.45 

 
Surveyor recommended 03 days for repair 
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Rachel Wu [mailto:RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg]  
Sent: Friday, 17 July 2020 8:01 PM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: Admin A 
Subject: RE: PROPOSAL ON LIABILITY [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20002407MFSH/1 // Our ref: 
CC4/FCI20006337/Ada3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC8138Z AND SGU3161E ON 10/06/2020] 
 
Dear Jia Le, 
 
Please proceed with express settlement. 
 
Thank you 
 
Best Regards 
 
Rachel Wu 
Motor Claim Department 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3862 
|  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 17 July 2020 4:44 pm 
To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 



4

Subject: RE: PROPOSAL ON LIABILITY [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20002407MFSH/1 // Our ref: 
CC4/FCI20006337/Ada3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC8138Z AND SGU3161E ON 10/06/2020] 
 
Dear Rachel, 
 
Attached herewith the Prelim report and third party estimate. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval on liability. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Rachel Wu [mailto:RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg]  
Sent: Friday, 17 July 2020 11:23 AM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: Admin A 
Subject: RE: PROPOSAL ON LIABILITY [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20002407MFSH/1 // Our ref: 
CC4/FCI20006337/Ada3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC8138Z AND SGU3161E ON 10/06/2020] 
 
Dear Jia Le, 
 
Kindly let us have your Prelim report. 
 
Thank you 
 
Best Regards 
 
Rachel Wu 
Motor Claim Department 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3862 
|  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: Rachel Wu  
Sent: Friday, 26 June 2020 12:25 pm 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: PROPOSAL ON LIABILITY [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20002407MFSH/1 // Our ref: 
CC4/FCI20006337/Ada3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC8138Z AND SGU3161E ON 10/06/2020] 
 
Dear Jia Le, 
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Kindly let us have your Prelim report. 
 
Thank you 
 
Best Regards 
 
Rachel Wu 
Motor Claim Department 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3862 
|  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 26 June 2020 11:20 am 
To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: PROPOSAL ON LIABILITY [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20002407MFSH/1 // Our ref: 
CC4/FCI20006337/Ada3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC8138Z AND SGU3161E ON 10/06/2020] 
 
Claim No: D20002407MFSH/1 
LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20006337/Ada3 
 
Dear Sirs/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 8138Z AND  SGU 3161E ON 10/06/2020 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Liability: 100%  
 
Remarks: The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the 2nd vehicle. In 
accordance to the MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval on liability. 
 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 


