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Summer Lee  (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 June, 2020 11:54 AM

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto)

Cc: SUR; Justin Wong; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

Subject: Fw: PRI Arrangement for SGQ 1357 S || C10006479

Attachments: SKZ6874M.pdf; SGQ1357S.pdf

Hi Team,  

 

We would like to arrange TP PRS for SGQ1357S.  TP chose Mr. Marcus Chua to survey this vehicle. 

 

Workshop information:  

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 

#02-24, Singapore 415875 

Mobile: +65 8811 2101 | Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 

 

Please confirm.  Thank you. 

 

 

Regards, 

  

Ivy Ratilla 
Executive, Claims Admin 
  
T +65 6540 2185 
F +65 6725 0853   
Eivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg 
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Customer Care +65 6221 2111 
Claims +65 6221 2199 
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 
  
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 
Singapore Shopping Centre 
Singapore 

239924                                                                                                                                  
budgetdirect.com.sg 
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From: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 16 June 2020 10:40 

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Cc: Justin Wong <justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: PRI Arrangement for SGQ 1357 S || C10006479  
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Dear all,  

  

Please have Marcus Chua survey the said vehicle.  

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

John Ong 

  

 
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 

#02-24, Singapore 415875 

Mobile: +65 8811 2101 | Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 

Email: claims@rico60.com 

  

 

 
From: Enquiry <claims@rico60.com> 

Sent: Monday, 15 June 2020 16:50 

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: PRI Arrangement for SGQ 1357 S  

  

Dear All, 

  

Kindly arrange PRI to survey the said vehicle as follows: 

  

Our Client – SGQ 1357 S    

Your Insured – SKZ 6874 M 

DOA – 14/06/2020 

  

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Shanelle Lim 

  
The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 

#02-24, Singapore 415875 

Mobile: +65 9187 8064| Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 

Email: enquiry@rico60.com 

  

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited, 

Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee. 

The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect 

views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the 

intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure 
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of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then 

delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.  
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