Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 August 2020 11:46 AM

To: Mekavathanan Sarangapani

Cc: Sundari Nagarajan - lll; Dhanya B.Purushothaman; KKLau; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: MCV2020D0001107 //LKK Ref: CC6/11120006332/Upa3

Attachments: PARF_COE REBATE.pdf

Hi Mr Meka,

Thank you for your email.
Please be informed that third party vehicle COE expiry date is on 30 Sep 2029.

Detail as follows: -

Market Value : $40,000.00 (est)
LTA Rebate : $27,388.00 (est)
Nett Value :$12,612.00 (est)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Mekavathanan Sarangapani <mekavathanan@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 19 August 2020 11:39 AM

To: KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
<olivialau@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Sundari Nagarajan - lll <sundari@iii.com.sg>; Dhanya B.Purushothaman <Dhanya@iii.com.sg>
Subject: FW: MCV2020D0001107

Dear LKK team

Following up on th query raised by my colleague :- query on margin for repair
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Cur.Req:5017.00;PODS Liability: 100% *Quantum: (a)CORwW/GST: $4,815.00 + (b)LOR(Z2days »
search fee: $2.00= Total: $5,017.00 *Vehicle Model: Honda Fit {1335cc) *4 recommendation re
£.

Cur Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date:2020/06/25. Mandate Remarks: 2009 model. Is it economical

Maintained: 2009 model. Is it economical to repair

T T

TP’s version & Sketch Plan :

' CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster]
Insured: |=, ID:=
Main Claimant: | FOO SAK MENG
: ] . |15/06/2020 00:00 - :55
Vehicle Reg. No.: SIM8569L DateofLass: 1128 Months and 4 Days From LTA |
Claim Type: TP / MCV202000001107 POICYICOVET | 5a0MCV0001463
Vehice Reg. No. | | Palicy No. ' -
(Insured): . GBEGB24A . (Claimant): . 5093351524-02
Repairer:  Fastech Auto Pte Ltd (HQ) [EETEINE 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 5, =01-46/48/50 Autobay, 417863 Kaki Bukit - Tel: 67465405
;‘:;";drz:ﬂ India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ... [Handled by Bhargavi Purushothaman Dhanyal
f";r::;‘f s NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Te!:
| | Adjuster: |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handied by MARCUS CHUA] ... [Final Rpt due 25/06/2020]
|| CLAIM REGISTERED

SRE LM FLAMN

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

T

Circumstances of Accident
| WAS DRIVING ALONG RIVERVALE DRIVE. AS | WAS DRIVING, THE CAR({SJMA563L) IN FRONT OF ME SUDDEMNLY A

ALEFT TURN INTO A COI
THE REAR OF THE SAID

Attachmentis]

NDO. AS A RESULT, | COULD NOT BRAKE IN TIME AND THE FRONT LEFT OF MY LORRY HI
CAR.

Nature and extent of damage to TP vehicle :
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U TP VEHICLE/IMN]

Relal

- BTN .. MVA320051821 submitted on 16/06/2020 11:01 to NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Li
o TP reported: GBEGB24A.

. ... MVA320051922 submitted on 16/06/2020 15:22 to India International Insurance Pte Ltd ..
o TP reported: SIMB569L.

Clm Details
Motified

Adj Mandate
Request

Adj Next Rpt
Changed

Adj Mandate

Cur.Req:5017.00:PODS Liability: 100% *Quantum: (a)CORwW/GST: $4,815.00 + (b)LOR(2days »
search fee: $2.00= Total: $5,017.00 *Vehicle Model: Honda Fit {133%cc) *4 recommendation re
e.

Cur Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date:2020/06/25. Mandate Remarks: 2009 model. Is it economical t

Maintained:200% model. Is it economical to repair




85691 [GEBEGE24A] - Submitted by: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

' CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster]

Insured: -, ID: =
Man Claimant:  FOO SAK MENG
' 3 . | 15/06/2020 00:00 - :59

Vehicle Reg. No.:| SIM8569L Date of Loss: | 458 Months and 4 Days From LTA |

Claim Type: | TP/ MCV2020D0001107 POICY/ICOVEr | pa0MCV0001463

Vehicle Reg. No. ' Palizy No. ' -

(Insured): GBEGE24A (Claimant): 5093351524-02

: | . Excess: .

Repairer: | Fastech Auto Pte Ltd (HQ) 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 5, 201-46/48/50 Autobay, 417883 Kaki Bukit - Tel: 67465405

:';tdri'r‘? India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ... [Handled by Bhargavi Purushothaman Dhanya]

Chimanka NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Te!:
| Adjuster: |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handied by MARCUS CHUA] ... [Final Rpt due 25/06/2020]
| CLAIM REGISTERED

From: Mekavathanan Sarangapani

Sent: Wednesday, 19 August 2020 10:55 am

To: atto@atto.com.sg

Cc: Dhanya B.Purushothaman <Dhanya@iii.com.sg>
Subject: MCV2020D0001107

Dear Jerome

As discussed, we will manage this claim for TPl (injury) from TP lawyers, Riaz at our end .
5
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Date OF Report 16/06/2020 15:10

Date Of Accident 150672020 21:30

Exact Locaton Of Accident RIVERVALE DRIVE

Country'Slate of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Riegistration Mumber GBEGA24A

insured/Policyholder

Mamea COf Registered Cwnar ATTO PTE. LIMITED
Circumstances of Accident

| WAS DRIVING ALONG RIVERVALE DRIVE. AS | WAS DRIVING, THE CAR(SJMB569L) IN FRONT OF ME SUDDEMLY MAJ
A LEFT TURN INTO A CONDO. AS A RESULT, | COULD NOT BRAKE IN TIME AND THE FRONT LEFT OF MY LORRY HIT
THE REAR OF THE SAID CAR.

Best Regards,

Mekavathanan
HOD
Motor & Work Injury Claims Department
India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street, #04/#05 IOB Building, Singapore 049711
DID: 6347 6105 Fax: 6224 4174
MDA
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This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. It may contain confidential and/or
legally privileged information. If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has
reached you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby notified that any
use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination of this information in any way or in any manner is
strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as
information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses. Therefore, we do not accept liability
for any errors or omissions in the content of this message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of
Internet transmission or any modification.



