Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Chhia Nyuk Pui <NyukPui_Chhia@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 July 2020 6:42 PM

To: ‘Jerome Soh'; Jacqueline Tan; SUR

Subject: MSIG ref: MSC/V/20-000565. : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLP 1919 S & FBM 8055 Y ON

09-JUN-2020 ALONG UPPER SERANGOON TRAFFIC JUNCTION AT ABOUT 1710 HOURS
Our Ref:AM-jt-Ins-K88-113448-20 (sj) Your Ref:  FBM 8055 Y

Dear Sir/Madam

Without Prejudice
Save as to Costs

We refer to your email of even date.
We are looking into your claim and shall come back to you soon

Aside to LKK,
Please upload report. Thanks

Regards,

&7 Please note that our Customer Service Centre will accept walk-ins by appointments only. For more details on how you can make an appointment
with us, please refer to our official Facebook page or our website at msig.com.sg.

Chhia Nyuk Pui
Senior Executive, Claims Services
Direct fax +65 6643 1349 | nyukpui_chhia@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | Tel +65 6220
9644 | Fax +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | www.msig.com.sg | Follow us on £l emsIG_sG

A member of QEESTEANE [NSURANCE GROUP

From: Jerome Soh <jeromesoh@visionlawllc.com>

Sent: Thursday, 2 July 2020 3:09 PM

To: Claims SG <claims@sg.msig-asia.com>

Cc: 'Jacqueline Tan' <jactan@Uvisionlawllc.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLP 1919 S & FBM 8055 Y ON 09-JUN-2020 ALONG UPPER SERANGOON TRAFFIC
JUNCTION AT ABOUT 1710 HOURS Our Ref: AM-jt-Ins-K88-113448-20 (sj) Your Ref: FBM 8055 Y

EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any attachment(s).

.Our Ref:  AM-jt-Ins-K88-113448-20 (sj)
Your Ref: FBM 8055Y



02 July 2020

MSIG INSURANCE (S’PORE) PTELTD WITHOUT PREJUDICE
4 Shenton Way

#21-01 SGX Centre 2

Singapore 068807

Attention: Motor Claim Department

Dear Sir,

CLAIMANT : LIM BENG KIAT
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLP 1919 S & FBM 8055 Y ON 09-JUN-2020 ALONG UPPER SERANGOON TRAFFIC
JUNCTION AT ABOUT 1710 HOURS

We are instructed by the above named to claim damages against you/your insured in connection with a road traffic accident
on 09-Jun-2020 ALONG UPPER SERANGOON TRAFFIC JUNCTION AT ABOUT 1710 HOURS involving our client’s
vehicle registration number SLP 1919 S and vehicle registration number FEBM 8055 Y driven by you/your insured at the
material time.

We are instructed that the accident was caused by you/your insured’s negligent driving and /or management of your/your
insured vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and our client has been put to loss and
expense, particulars of which are as follows:-

1. Cost of Repair $1,551.50 (Agreed with SJE)
2. Loss of Use for 02 days at $200.00 per day $ 400.00

3. Additional 2 days loss of use for pre repair $ 400.00

4. Police/GIA search/report + LTA fees $ 10.00

5. Cost Contribution (at this stage) $ 900.00

6. Disbursements (at this stage) $ 50.00

7. 7% GST of Cost Contribution $ 63.00

TOTAL: $3.374.50

We enclose a copy of each of the following documents for your consideration:-

(a) Police/GIA/SAS report lodged by driver of SLP 1919 S;

(b) LTANet Search;

(c) Certificate of Insurance;

(d) Final Repair Bill;

We have on 11 June 2020 notified your insurers MSIG INSURANCE (S’PORE) PTE LTD of the accident and a pre-
repair inspection of our client’s vehicle was carried out by your insurer.

Please note that if you are insured and you wish to claim under your insurance policy, you should immediately pass this
letter and all the enclosed documents to your insurer.

Please note that you or your insurer should send to us an acknowledgement of receipt of this letter within 14 days of your
receipt of this letter, failing which our client will have no alternative but to commence proceedings against you without further
notice to you or your insurer. Our client’s claim herein is quantified based on supporting documents in our file. Until a
settlement is reached, all negotiations are conducted on the basis that the damages quantified herein are subject to revision
if so instructed by our client.

Please also note that if you have a counterclaim against our client arising out of the accident, you are also required to send
to us a letter giving full particulars of the counterclaim together with all relevant supporting documents within 8 weeks of
your receipt of this letter.

Jerome Soh (on behalf of Anjalli M)
Assistant Secretary



Vision Law LLC

133 New Bridge Road
#18-01/02 Chinatown Point
Singapore 059413

Tel: 6534-2811 Fax: 6535-6802

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Address : 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for the
recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email

by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing and/or
disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any

person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any errors or
omissions in the contents resulting from email

transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any person
other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended recipient,
please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.



