
1

Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Catherine Chua <catherine.chua@eurokars.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 24 August 2020 11:08 AM
To: JASONTEA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Cc: Insurance Claims
Subject: SJX9876K - THIRD PARTY CLAIMS YOUR REF: D20002352MFSH
Attachments: REPAIR INV,DV,LOA.pdf

Dear Jason 
 
The repairs have been completed for SLD240K. We submit the following claims with supporting documents for your 
perusal:- 
 

1) Invoice No. 30013644 $3,613.93 
2) Loss of Use (3 days X $100.00) 300.00 
3) LTA/GIA Search Fees  
4) Letter of Authorization  
5) Discharge Voucher  

Please pay $3,613.93 to Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd, $300.00 to Mr Elango s/o 
Kanakasabai Padayachi       

$3,913.93 

 
We look forward to receiving your offer/Discharge Voucher soon. 
 
Note : Documents are sent by email only 
 
Thanks n Regards  

 
Catherine Chua  
Insurance Claims Executive 
T: (65) 6331 0680 D: (65) 6331 0691 
E: catherine.chua@eurokars.com.sg     
 
This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential 
and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message 
from your system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you. 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 19 January 2021 2:08 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan
Subject: Wait for 2 weeks as LOD just send to INSD & ID  YOUR REF: D20002352MFSH/1 

(OUR REF: CC4/FCI20006300/R1gs3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 8579C & SJX 
9876K ON 30/05/2020 *** - REVISED!!!!!!!

Dear Cecilia,  
 
Please hold until 2 of Feb 2021(two weeks from today) , as we are going to send the LOD to Insured & ID, reason to 
hold just in case our ID dispute on the damages  
 
If you did not hear from us on 2 Feb 2021, you may proceed to make an offer for settlement. 
 
Mandate given $ 3,913.93 
 
 
 
Jason Tea 
Motor Claim Department 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 
3860|  Fax No. : 6507 3849|Email: JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C 
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please 
refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the 
addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have 
received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the 
sender immediately by return e-mail 
 
As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are 
on Work From Home arrangement. However, we are actively working to support our clients and 
partners. We have access to e-mails and will work to respond in a timely manner.  
  
We appreciate your kind understanding. Stay safe. 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 19 January 2021 12:20 
To: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: To Do before write to me for mandate YOUR REF: D20002352MFSH/1 (OUR REF: 
CC4/FCI20006300/R1gs3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 8579C & SJX 9876K ON 30/05/2020 *** - REVISED!!!!!!! 
 
Hi Jason, 
 
Case review: 100% BOLA S27 (rear ended case).  
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Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please 
refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the 
addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have 
received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the 
sender immediately by return e-mail 
 
As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are 
on Work From Home arrangement. However, we are actively working to support our clients and 
partners. We have access to e-mails and will work to respond in a timely manner.  
  
We appreciate your kind understanding. Stay safe. 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 15 January 2021 15:27 
To: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: YOUR REF: D20002352MFSH/1 (OUR REF: CC4/FCI20006300/R1gs3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 
8579C & SJX 9876K ON 30/05/2020 *** - REVISED!!!!!!! 
 
 

Your ref : D20002352MFSH/1 

Our ref : CC4/FCI20006300/R1gs3 

  

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 8579C & SJX 9876K ON 30/05/2020 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

It is a head-to-rear collision. Liability is not in our driver’s favour. 

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be 
affected. 

  

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD " at $3,913.93. 

  

The summary is as follows: - 

  
 Amount Claimed Amount Revised 
Cost of Repair (w/GST) $  6,807.23 $ 3,613.93 
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Loss of Use (3DAYS X 
$100.00) 

$    300.00 $    300.00 (3days x $100.00) 

Loss of Income  $     - $     - 
LTA/GIA Search Fee $     - $     - 
Total $ 7,107.23 $ 3,913.93 

 

  

**03 days recommendation for repair 

  

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 

  

For your approval/instruction please. 
 
 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email:  CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 




