Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 2 October 2020 2:19 PM

To: 'Ong Hua Yen (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & |A/Buses)’; Admin A

Cc: Chong Fei Yuan (Auto Svcs/Claims & I1A/Claims & 1A); Balgish Binte Abdul Halil

(Auto Svcs/Claims & I1A/Claims & |A/Buses); Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims &
IA/Claims & IA/Buses); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims &
IA/Buses)

Subject: RE: OUR REF:BUS/06/20/5005 - ACCIDENT ON 03/06/20 INVOLVING SMB37E AND
GBH4451P ALONG JUNCTION OF JELEBU ROAD AND PETIR ROAD

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Kindly let us have a copy of video footage for our viewing.

Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ong Hua Yen (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) [mailto:OngHuaYen@smrt.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 26 August 2020 5:41 PM

To: Admin A; CS A Team

Cc: Chong Fei Yuan (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA); Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims &
IA/Buses); Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims &
IA/Claims & IA/Buses)

Subject: OUR REF:BUS/06/20/5005 - ACCIDENT ON 03/06/20 INVOLVING SMB37E AND GBH4451P ALONG JUNCTION
OF JELEBU ROAD AND PETIR ROAD

Dear Sirs,

We claim on behalf of SMRT Buses Ltd, owner of the vehicle registration number SMB37E. Your client's
negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses,

Cost of Repair $1,150.00

Loss of Use $275.00 ( 1 daysx $275.00 )

LTA search fee $7.00

Total $1,432.00




1)
2)

We enclose the following
documents,

1) Repair Invoice

2) GlA report

3) LTA Search

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email.
Payment by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT Buses Ltd.

Thanks & Regards
Hua Yen



