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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 August 2020 8:43 AM

To: William Tan; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: SLX408P, Accident dated 12 June 2020.

Dear William, 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to SOMPO INSURANCE 

 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 13 August 2020 6:11 PM 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; 

William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com> 

Subject: SLX408P, Accident dated 12 June 2020. 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

I accept part by part items, cost of repair amount at $4,808.80 and agreed 4 days repair work. 

 

By the way, all documents send to LKK or directly to Sompo Insurance ? 

 


