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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 June 2020 2:32 pm

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: skh 2743d paper survey.

Hi Shirley, 

 

Final amount $16,450. Repair day7 days. (L/S, before gst). 

 

Item 54 have change. 

 

Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
 

LKK Auto Consultants 
 

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

 

From: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Wednesday, June 24, 2020 5:25 PM 

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: skh 2743d paper survey. 

 

Hi Shirley, 

 

Please refer attachment. 

 

Final amount $16,450. Repair day 12 days. (L/S, before gst). 

 

Item 54 have change. 

 

Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
 

LKK Auto Consultants 
 

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

 



2

From: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Tuesday, June 23, 2020 6:46 PM 

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: skh 2743d paper survey. 

 

Hi Shirley, 
 
I had amend the amount. 
 
The S/N item 8 have CRA. I had put the remark. 
 
Final amount $17,150. Please refer attachment. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
 

LKK Auto Consultants 
 

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 
 

From: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Tuesday, June 23, 2020 2:49 PM 

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: skh 2743d paper survey. 

 

Hi Shirley, 
 
Please refer attachment. 
 
Final amount $17,500. (L/S, before gst). 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
 

LKK Auto Consultants 
 

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

 

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Monday, June 22, 2020 10:54 AM 

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: skh 2743d paper survey. 
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Hi Sun Pin, 

 

Please refer to the below email above matter. 

 

Kindly assist the paper survey on behalf of RAM to check parts prices. 

 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 

of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 22 June 2020 10:42 am 

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: skh 2743d paper survey. 

 

Hi Shirley, 

 

Please pass this case to Sun Pin and inform him need to check part prices. Thanks 

 

 
 
Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 19 June 2020 5:24 PM 

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: skh 2743d paper survey. 
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Hi Celine, 

 

Please let me know Ram cases who are going take on behalf. 

 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 

of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

From: Parasuram (LKK Auto) <Parasuram@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 17 June 2020 10:43 am 

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: skh 2743d paper survey. 

 

The lumpsum amount isn’t confirm. It’s based on their initial price. 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 

Best Regards, 

Parasuram| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
 

LKK Auto Consultants 
 

Phone: 6741 3061 | Email:  Parasuram@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 


