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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 28 July 2020 6:01 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Su Li (LKK Auto); MT_Claim_SG
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLA 2906B (OI : LPC - 

20/20/20/VP05/023394) AND SLT 8053Y (TP : LKK REF - CC6/LPC20006263/Ugs3) on 
12/06/2020 [External General]

Lonpac External - General 
Dear Cecilia 
 
Please proceed. 
 
 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse  
Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices. 
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 
 
From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Friday, 24 July 2020 10:44 AM 
To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLA 2906B (OI : LPC - 20/20/20/VP05/023394) AND SLT 8053Y (TP : 
LKK REF - CC6/LPC20006263/Ugs3) on 12/06/2020 [External General] 
 

Lonpac Ref: 20/20/20/VP05/023394 

LKK Ref: CC6/LPC20006263/Ugs3 

  

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 


