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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 3 June 2021 3:20 PM
To: advantautogarage@gmail.com
Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SLJ2595S

Without Prejudice 
 
Hi Moe, 
 
As spoken, your client has engaged M/s C Yogarajah LLC for the PD claim. 
 
If you want to expedite and settle PD claim directly with AIG, you need to get your client to withdraw his solicitors. 
 
You can contact AIG claim officer Mr Tee at 6419 1089 for clarifications if necessary. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
  

From: Advant Auto Garage <advantautogarage@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, 3 June 2021 2:49:17 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLJ2595S 

Hi Boss  
 
Any updates?  
 
Thks.. 
 
On Thu, May 20, 2021 at 10:22 PM Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Moe, 

  

My office have email AIG on the payment issue, will update you soonest when AIG reply, thank you. 
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Regards 

Taufikh 

  

From: Advant Auto Garage [mailto:advantautogarage@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 20 May 2021 11:07 AM 
To: Taufikh (LKK Auto) 
Subject: SLJ2595S 

  

Hi Bang 

  

Selamat Hari Raya! 

  

Can I check the status of SLJ2595S? 

  

I have yet to receive any payment for the repairs. 

  

I can be contacted at 94565427. 

  

Thks, Moe 


