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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 15 December 2020 8:55 AM
To: 'Chew Goon Motor(ad3)'
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKM 6589E (OUR REF: CC4/AIG20006043/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING GBJ 7373B & SKM 6589E ON 23/05/2020 ***

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Kelly, 
 
We refer to the above matter’ 
 
Liability clear.  
 
Please proceed.  
 
Thanks  
 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 
 
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) [mailto:ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg]  
Sent: Monday, 14 December 2020 2:24 PM 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKM 6589E (OUR REF: CC4/AIG20006043/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 7373B & SKM 
6589E ON 23/05/2020 *** 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
We refer to below email, there is no dispute or conflicting version. 
Both parties state that 

- SKM6589E – GBJ7373B came out at high speed from my right side. 
- GBJ7373B – Driving up the slope from B1 to L1, as I was turn out SKM6589E was driving straight & hit onto 

my vehicle. 
 
Both parties statement are similar, your insured drove up the slope & while turning out, collided with our client. 
Liability is clear in our favour. 
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Thanks & Regards, 
Kelly 
 
Chew Goon Motor 
Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A, 
Ave 5 #01-15 , 16 & 17, 
Ang Mo Kio Autopoint 
Singapore 568047 
Tel : 6484 1626 
Fax : 6484 0465 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) 
Sent: Monday, 2 November 2020 12:01 PM 
To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) 
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKM 6589E (OUR REF: CC4/AIG20006043/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 7373B & SKM 
6589E ON 23/05/2020 *** 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Kelly, 
 
As there is no evidence to support the claim for both parties, thus this matter will be settle based by conflicting 
version.  
 
In view of above, we maintained stand at 50/50 settlement.  
 
Thanks  
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. 
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 28 October 2020 11:10 AM 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
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Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKM 6589E (OUR REF: CC4/AIG20006043/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 7373B & SKM 
6589E ON 23/05/2020 *** 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
There is no dispute in how the accident happened. 
Your insured was driving up the slope & entering into level 1, he should exercise caution. 
 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
Kelly 
 
Chew Goon Motor 
Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A, 
Ave 5 #01-15 , 16 & 17, 
Ang Mo Kio Autopoint 
Singapore 568047 
Tel : 6484 1626 
Fax : 6484 0465 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) 
Sent: Tuesday, 18 August 2020 5:35 PM 
To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) 
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKM 6589E (OUR REF: CC4/AIG20006043/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 7373B & SKM 
6589E ON 23/05/2020 *** 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Kelly, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no concrete evidence(ie: Video footage) yet 
to support either party’s version.  
 
Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client’s claim in the 
above matter without resort to litigation, we are prepared to offer 50% towards your client's claim. 
 
Please confirm. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. 
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Thursday, 18 June 2020 2:57 PM 
To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKM 6589E (OUR REF: CC4/AIG20006043/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 7373B & SKM 
6589E ON 23/05/2020 *** 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Keely, 
 
Content noted.  
 
Then we shall wait for OI video footage to review liability.  
 
Kindly note that if both parties has got no video footage to support their claim, it will be based on conflicting version 
of 50% settlement.  
 
Thanks  
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. 
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 18 June 2020 2:39 PM 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKM 6589E (OUR REF: CC4/AIG20006043/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 7373B & SKM 
6589E ON 23/05/2020 *** 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
No video. 
Liability is clear. 
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Thanks & Regards, 
Kelly 
 
Chew Goon Motor 
Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A, 
Ave 5 #01-15 , 16 & 17, 
Ang Mo Kio Autopoint 
Singapore 568047 
Tel : 6484 1626 
Fax : 6484 0465 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) 
Sent: Wednesday, 17 June 2020 3:32 PM 
To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) 
Subject: YOUR REF: SKM 6589E (OUR REF: CC4/AIG20006043/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 7373B & SKM 
6589E ON 23/05/2020 *** 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
The liability is unclear. 
 
Kindly let us have a copy of Video footage to review the liability. 
 
Attached is a copy of OI’ report. 
 
Thanks  
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. 
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
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