Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 21 April 2021 4:46 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: Janice Goh; Andre Chow En De; Loi Ai Ting; Jojo Cheng; Coco Lu Ting; Edwin
Abcede Caina

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SIM36K (EQ)  Our Ref: SMA2261R  DOA: 09/06/2020

Dear Jasper,

Pls. refer to our bank details below.

Account Name Cycle & Carriage Automotive Pte Ltd
Account Number 01-0-141927-9
Bank Name Standard Chartered Bank (Singapore) Pte Limited
Bank Code 9496
Branch Name Battery Road Branch
Branch Code 001
Email Address receivables@cyclecarriage.com.sg
Thanks

Best regards,

Larry Songcuan
Customer Service

@@ Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cycle & Carriage Singapore « 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 6568 4658 + F: +65 6565 1240 « www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

u‘?) A member of the Jardine Cycle & Carriage Group

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: 21 April 2021 04:38 PM

To: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Cc: Janice Goh <janice.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>; Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai
Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Jojo Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting
<coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Edwin Abcede Caina <edwin.caina@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: Your Ref: SIM36K (EQ) Our Ref: SMA2261R DOA: 09/06/2020

This email was sent from outside of your organisation
Hi Larry,

Please be informed that EQ is moving into E-payment modes.



Kindly provide bank details as below :

Account Name
Account Number
Bank Name

Bank & Branch Code

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 April 2021 12:11 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Janice Goh <janice.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>; Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai
Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Jojo Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting
<coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Edwin Abcede Caina <edwin.caina@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SIM36K (EQ) Our Ref: SMA2261R DOA: 09/06/2020

Dear Jasper,
We accept your offer of $ 11,604.01
We will be expecting to receive the payment if DV is waived.

Thank you so much.

Best regards,

Larry Songcuan
Customer Service

@(@: Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cycle & Carriage Singapore * 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 6568 4658 + F: +65 6565 1240 « www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

5‘ A member of the Jardine Cycle & Carriage Group

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@l|kkauto.com>

Sent: 07 April 2021 01:58 PM

To: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; janice.goh@eqginsurance.com.sg

Cc: Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Jojo Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting
<coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Admin A
<admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Your Ref: SIM36K (EQ) Our Ref: SMA2261R DOA: 09/06/2020




This email was sent from outside of your organisation
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $10,532.01
2. Loss of Rental (w/GST) (10 days x $100.00) | $ 1,070.00
3. GIA Search Fee $ 2.00

Total | $ 11,604.01

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 5 April 2021 1:27 PM

To: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; janice.goh@eginsurance.com.sg

Cc: Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Jojo Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting
<coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: Your Ref: SIM36K (EQ) Our Ref: SMA2261R DOA: 09/06/2020

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir/ Madam,
We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that our insured is disputing on the liability. We are currently in the midst of handling
our insured.

We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”
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