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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Songcuan JR Lauro Araos <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 30 July 2020 11:34 AM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Andre Chow En De; Loi Ai Ting; Jojo Cheng; Edwin Abcede Caina
Subject: Your Ref: SJM36K (EQ)      Our Ref: SMA2261R     DOA: 09/06/2020
Attachments: scan.pdf

Dear Jasper, 
 
Pls. refer to attached LOD. 
 
Our customer claims as follows. 
 
Cost of repair                     $ 10,532.01 
Loss of rental                     $   1,284.00   ($128.40 x 10 days) 
GIA search fee                   $          2.00 
                                                ---------------- 
Total                                      $ 11,818.01 
 
Appreciate if you could quantify your offer of settlement the soonest. 
 
Thank you so much. 
 
 
Best regards, 
 
Larry Songcuan 
Customer Service 
 
 

 
 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
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notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you 
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any 
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd 
and/or any of its related corporations.  


