Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: SK Admin <admin@skauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 5 November 2020 6:21 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: Julie Johari; Simon Koh; KY Leong; Tyson Koh; Yvette Zhao; Admin A

Subject: Re: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA 5510S & YOUR REF: SMG 8241C on 10.06.2020
***L KK REF: CC4/A1G20006168/Ada3

Dear Jia Le,

Thanks for your mail

We counter propose Loss of used @ S$250.00 x 16 days=S$4,000.00 (Nissan Urvan 3.0 )
Pls reconsider the proposed amount and revert back to us soon.

Thank you

Regards,

Huey Lee
SK Automobile Pte Ltd

On Thu, Nov 5, 2020 at 4:42 PM Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Huey Lee,

We propose settlement as follows:-

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 16,050.00
2. Loss of Use (16days x $100) $ 1,600.00
3. GIA/LTA Search Fee $ 2.00
TOTAL $17,652.00

Please confirm acceptance.
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much

regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: SK Admin [mailto:admin@skauto.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 6 October 2020 4:33 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Julie Johari; Jia Le (LKK Auto); Simon Koh; KY Leong; Tyson Koh; Yvette Zhao; CS A Team; Admin A
Subject: Re: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA 5510S & YOUR REF: SMG 8241C on 10.06.2020 ***LKK REF:
CC4/AIG20006168/Ada3

Dear Jia Le,

Kindly assist to update the claim status / offer of the above mentioned case.

Pls check & revert to us the soonest.

Greatly appreciate it if you could expedite the matter.

Thank you

Regards,
Huey Lee
SK Automobile Pte Ltd

On Fri, Jul 17, 2020 at 3:03 PM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.



Hi Jia Le,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted

From: Julie Johari <julie@skauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 17 July, 2020 12:55 PM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Simon Koh <simon@skauto.com.sg>; KY Leong <kyleong@skauto.com.sg>; SK Admin
<admin@skauto.com.sg>; Tyson Koh <tysonkoh@skauto.com.sg>; Yvette Zhao
<yvette(@skauto.com.sg>

Subject: Re: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA 5510S & YOUR REF: SMG 8241C on 10.06.2020

Dear Sir/ Mdm:

Attached traffic police result.



Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any queries thereof.

Best Regards,

Ms Julie

SK Automobile Pte L1d (201500047H)
23 Katki Bukit Avenue 4

#03-01 VICOM Inspection Centre
Singapore 415933

Tel: 6789 5155

Fax: 6783 5155

On Wed, Jul 15, 2020 at 3:56 PM Julie Johari <julie@skauto.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam, "WITHOUT PREJUDICE"

Enclosed the final bill and relevant documents for your attention.

Kindly refer to attachment and revert back to us the soonest.

Breakdown as below:

Cost of Repair : S$ 16,050.00

Loss of Rental :S$ 4,800.00 (16 days x S$300.00)

LTA Search :S 2.00

Total : 8$ 20,852.00

If acceptable, kindly forward your discharge voucher to us to enable our client to complete and sign.

We appreciate your early reply



Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any queries thereof.

Best Regards,

M8 Julie

SK Automodbite Pte Ltd (201500047F)
23 Katki Bukit Avenue 4

#03-01 VICOM Inspection Centre
Singapore 415933

Tel: 6789 5155

Fax: 6783 5155

DID: 9623 4440 / 9099 6204



