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Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, June 24, 2020 5:34 PM

To: Daphne Lee

Subject: RE: Finalize - XE7088R 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 
Dear Daphne, 
 
Confirm the lump sum amount $6,250. Repair days 4 days. (before gst). 

 
Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
 

LKK Auto Consultants 
 

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

 

From: Daphne Lee [mailto:daphne@convinceauto.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, June 24, 2020 2:00 PM 

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Finalize - XE7088R  

 
Dear Sun Pin, 

 

Can we close Lumpsum at $6,250.00 ($7,850.21 – 20%) + GST and 4 days? 

 

Thank you 

 

Regards 

 

Daphne Lee 

 
 

Convince Auto Pte Ltd 

176 Sin Ming Drive 

#04-04 Sin Ming Autocare 

Singapore 575721 

 

Tel: 6556 1131  |  Fax: 6553 0802 

 


