Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 11 June 2020 9:17 AM
To: Loganathan Agoram; SUR

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: MV for SLS2542Y

Dear Logan,

The MV of SLS 2542Y is $58K-560K(est) as at May 2020.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thanks & Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms)
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: Loganathan Agoram [mailto:loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 11 June 2020 8:41 AM

To: SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: MV for SLS2542Y

HI Team,

Any updates on the MV?
Thank you

Regards,

Logan
Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2186
F +65 6725 0853
E loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg

auto & general

It pays to choose

Budget
Direct
msurance

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore 239924



Platinum S8 8 4
Trusted Service Award

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

From: Loganathan Agoram

Sent: Wednesday, 10 June 2020 11:47 AM
To: 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments@I|kkauto.com

Subject: MV for SLS2542Y

Importance: High

Hi Team,

Seeking your assistance to provide MV for vehicle SLS2542Y.



Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle Cloooé22e [LA.

Vehicle Owner Particulars Hitachi Capital Asia Pac
Owner |D Type: Singapore NRIC VoA Z4.0%. 2020 -
Owner |D: 7581

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.: SLS2542Y

Vehicle to be Exported: Yes

Intended Deregistration Date: 04 May 2020

Vehicle Make: SUZUKI

Wehicle Model: SWIFTHYBRID 1.2RSCVT

Primary Colour: Red

Manufacturing Year: 2017

Engine No.: K12C52146746

Chassis No: 2535108482

Maximum Power Output: 69,3 kW (92 bhp)

Open Market Value: $17,753.00

Original Registration Date: 155ep 2017

First Registration Date: 15 Sep 2017

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $7.753.00 _

Intended PARF Rebate Details Pact’: $3876.00 -

PARF Eligibility: Yes "

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 14 Sep 2027

PARF Rebate Amount: $5.814.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 14 Sep 2027 Batance, ??’” Saranths .
COE Category: A-Carupto 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp) = T4 byrs .
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $46,778.00

COE Rebate Amount: $34,433.00

Total Rebate Amount: $40,247.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 04 May 2020
Thank you

Logan
Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2186
F +65 6725 0853
E loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Singapore 239924
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This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte.
Limited, Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the
intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated
author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may
be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any
use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please
immediately notify the sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is
error or virus free.



