9/6/21, 3:41 PM Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: 1095141663SG *** LKK REF: CC4/A1G20006045/Fpa3

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Mon 6/9/2021 3:41 PM

To: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Hi Chee Heng,
Third party counter proposed to settle the matter at $2,507.44(all-in).
We have reseek mandate in Merimen. For your instruction please.

Re: Your Ref: T 0520/SHC3995Z/ KS(st) // LKK Ref: CC4/A1G20006045/Fpa3
[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLP 1819Y(AIG) AND SHC 3995Z ON 29/05/2020]

Mon 6/9/2021 3:19 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

@ Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg> I R

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We can agree as follows:- $2,507.44

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $2,274.95
2. Loss of Rental Waive by CDGE due to Covid-19.
3. Loss of Income S 225.00
4. LTA/ GIA Search Fee S 7.49

** P.s - We are recovering the Loss of Income on behalf of Mr Lim Chang Huat being the hirer of SHC
3995Z. Your principal had compensated (if any) the LOI to Mr Lee Yoke Choy during the period he
was unable to drive (MC).

Best Regards
Kazali Hj Selahudin (Mr)

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 19 August 2021 11:35 am

To: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: 1095141663SG *** LKK REF: CC4/A1G20006045/Fpa3

Hi Chee Heng,

We are pending for acceptance from third party. Offer was made on 27/12/2020 and last reminder to third
party was on 11/08/2021.

Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 19 August 2021 10:52 AM

To: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 1095141663SG *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG20006045/Fpa3

Dear Chee Heng,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi HT,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Loh, Chee-Heng [mailto:Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com]
Sent: Thursday, August 19, 2021 10:50 AM
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To: Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: 1095141663SG

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Adjuster mandate has been given in Nov 2020.

Kindly assist to let us have an update.

Thank you.

Loh Chee Heng

Senior Complex Claims Examiner — Auto Property Damage Claims
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AIG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10

Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1881
Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com | www.AlG.sg

If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, | do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate

for you.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error,
please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any
virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is
the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by
American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any
loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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