Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 December 2021 9:38 AM

To: ‘Annie’

Cc: Admin A; 'Lesli Ee'; 'Serene Lim'

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF3101Z(AlIG) AND SHD9922P ON 28/05/2020
Attachments: SIGNED MUTUAL SETTLEMENT.pdf

Hi Ms Annie,

Attached is a copy of mutual settlement form signed by both parties for your necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 December 2021 9:32 AM

To: Annie <annieloh@popularcar.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'Lesli Ee' <lesli@popularcar.com>; 'Serene Lim' <serenelim@popularcar.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF3101Z(AIG) AND SHD9922P ON 28/05/2020

Dear Ms Annie,

We acknowledge receipt of the following 2 cheques:

1. $ 1,450.00 payable to Trans-cab Services Pte Ltd
2. $ 365.94 payable to LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

We will proceed to close file at our end.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 November 2021 2:47 PM

To: Annie <annieloh@popularcar.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'Lesli Ee' <lesli@popularcar.com>; 'Serene Lim' <serenelim@popularcar.com>
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF3101Z(AIG) AND SHD9922P ON 28/05/2020

Hi Annie,
Thank you for your email.

We will look out for the cheque.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Annie <annieloh@popularcar.com>

Sent: Friday, 26 November 2021 5:39 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'Lesli Ee' <lesli@popularcar.com>; 'Serene Lim' <serenelim@popularcar.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF3101Z(AIG) AND SHD9922P ON 28/05/2020

Dear Hsiao Tong,



Thanks for your call earlier.

Yes we agree to settle privately and | attached herewith the duly signed mutual settlement form.
We will process the cheque payment and arrange to mail out next week.

Thank you.

Regards,

Annie Loh

Assistant Manager

Popular Rent A Car Pte Ltd

501 Guillemard Road, Singapore 399840
Tel: 6742 8888

Fax: 6743 3003

WhizzCar - Wheels on Demand since 2003

www.whizzcar.com

Popular Rent A Car - Smooth rides and peace of mind since 1996

www.popularcar.com

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, November 26, 2021 5:25 PM

To: Annie

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF3101Z(AIG) AND SHD9922P ON 28/05/2020

Dear Ms Annie,

We refer to the above matter and our tele-conversation earlier.

We wish to inform you that AIG had reviewed your policy and noted there is a section Il excess of $3,000 is
applicable as settlement under excess. Since third party’s claim amount (refer below) is within the excess amount,

we would advise you to settle the matter privately.

The breakdown of third-party claim is as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (with GST) $1,284.00
2. Loss of Rental (2days x $81.13) S 162.26
4. LTA/GIA Search fee S 7.45

Total | $1,453.71
Global Sum | $1,450.00

| LKK Professional Fee (with GST) |$ 365.94

Please issue the following 2 cheques:

1. $ 1,450.00 payable to Trans-cab Services Pte Ltd
2. $ 365.94 payable to LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

You may send your payment by post to:
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD



51 Ubi Avenue 1
#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

With the following attachments:

1. your cheque payment;
2. the signed private settlement letter (scan copy will do).

Please let us have your decision within the next 7 days.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)




