3/20/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Your Ref: T 0520/ SHD4626C/KS(st) // Our Ref: CC4/AIG20006014/Fps3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING EX 2628R(AIG) AND SHD 4626C ON 28/05/2020]

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sat 20/3/2021 12:15 PM

To: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>

0 1 attachments (192 KB)
DV_SHD4626C.pdf;

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We confirm settlement at $2,907.49(all-in).

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 February 2021 2:51 PM

To: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: T 0520/ SHD4626C/KS(st) // Our Ref: CC4/AIG20006014/Fps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EX
2628R(AIG) AND SHD 4626C ON 28/05/2020]

Without Prejudice

Hi Kazali,

We are pending further mandate from AIG.
We will follow up and get back to you.
Kindly bear with us for time being.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

https://outlook.office.com/mail/deeplink?popoutv2=1&version=20210315003.13 1/8


mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com

3/20/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 25 February 2021 1:38 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: T 0520/ SHD4626C/KS(st) // Our Ref: CC4/AIG20006014/Fps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EX
2628R(AIG) AND SHD 4626C ON 28/05/2020]

Importance: High

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Can we have your confirmation of settlement please? Thank you.

Best Regards

Kazali Hj Selahudin

Claims Department / ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8736 / Fax: 6214 1843

- i} Think Before Printing

From: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 February 2021 1:55 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: T 0520/ SHD4626C/KS(st) // Our Ref: CC4/AIG20006014/Fps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EX
2628R(AIG) AND SHD 4626C ON 28/05/2020]

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Our taxi was laid off road for more than 4 days (weekend inclusive). We counter propose settlement

at $2,907.49 instead. Kindly let us have your principal's DV for our execution and early return. Thank
you.
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Best Regards

Kazali Hj Selahudin

Claims Department / ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8736 / Fax: 6214 1843

;"""i. Thinmlk Defrra D |
. i} 1NINK &erore Frinting 5

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Sunday, 31 January 2021 11:26 AM

To: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: T 0520/ SHD4626C/KS(st) // Our Ref: CC4/AlIG20006014/Fps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EX
2628R(AIG) AND SHD 4626C ON 28/05/2020]

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open
attachment unless you know the sender.

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our email dated 21 Aug 2020.
Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 28 December 2020 5:12 PM

To: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: T 0520/ SHD4626C/KS(st) // Our Ref: CC4/AIG20006014/Fps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EX
2628R(AIG) AND SHD 4626C ON 28/05/2020]

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our email dated 21 Aug 2020.
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Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

""Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 November 2020 12:27 PM

To: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: T 0520/ SHD4626C/KS(st) // Our Ref: CC4/AIG20006014/Fps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EX
2628R(AIG) AND SHD 4626C ON 28/05/2020]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our email dated 21 Aug 2020.
Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,

whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
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regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 October 2020 10:16 AM

To: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: T 0520/ SHD4626C/KS(st) // Our Ref: CC4/AIG20006014/Fps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EX
2628R(AIG) AND SHD 4626C ON 28/05/2020]

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to our email dated 21 Aug 2020.

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 21 August 2020 2:57 PM

To: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: T 0520/ SHD4626C/KS(st) // Our Ref: CC4/AIG20006014/Fps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EX
2628R(AIG) AND SHD 4626C ON 28/05/2020]

Without Prejudice
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Dear Kazali,
Thank you for your email.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 2,675.00
2. Loss of Rental Waived during CB period
3. Loss of Income (4days x $50.00) | $ 200.00
4. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 7.49
Total | $ 2,882.49

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 14 August 2020 4:28 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: T 0520/ SHD4626C/KS(st) // Our Ref: CC4/A1G20006014/Fps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EX
2628R(AIG) AND SHD 4626C ON 28/05/2020]

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Since your principal's insured had admitted that T/Light was red and he/she could not stop in time, we
regret that we are unable to consider your request. Kindly assist to settle our claims accordingly since
liability is not an issue. Thank you.

Best Regards
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Claims Department / ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8736 / Fax: 6214 1843
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 14 August 2020 3:16 PM
To: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: Your Ref: T 0520/ SHD4626C/KS(st) // Our Ref: CC4/AIG20006014/Fps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EX

2628R(AIG) AND SHD 4626C ON 28/05/2020]

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open

attachment unless you know the sender.

Your Ref: T 0520/ SHD4626C/KS(st) Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC4/A1G20006014/Fps3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING EX 2628R(AIG) AND SHD 4626C ON 28/05/2020

We refer to the above matter.

Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

We would like to request a copy of video footage as stated in your client accident report for our necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,

whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially

affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly
notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any
contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro
Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals.
Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition
except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage
you to print this only if necessary.

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly
notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any
contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro
Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals.
Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition
except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage
you to print this only if necessary.

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]
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