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Re: TCS REF: AAD1704-069--Accident involving SCR333J (AXA) & SHD0178E on 05.04.17 ***
LKK REF: CC3/AIG17006886/Kea3q2-1

Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Wed 1/13/2021 11:09 AM
To:  Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Your Ref: AAD1704-069 

‘WITHOUT	PREJUDICE’
		SAVE	AS	TO	COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,
 
We refer to the above ma�er.
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 178E AND SCR 333J ON 05/04/2017
 
Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the en�re negligence of your client rear ended our
insured vehicle. 
 
We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor.
 
Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruc�on to deny liability and unable
to look into your client’s claim.

Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed. 

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 
Sent: Tuesday, November 17, 2020 11:05 AM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1704-069--Accident involving SCR333J (AXA) & SHD0178E on 05.04.17 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG17006886/Kea3q2-1
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Asher
 
Please advise your offering soon so that we can expedite and process the claims.
 
Thank You
Best Regards,
Ng Wai Yin
Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308
 
* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the
conduct of this ma�er to our solicitors without further reference to you.
 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111
Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764
 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 27 May, 2020 9:06 PM 
To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1704-069--Accident involving SCR333J (AXA) & SHD0178E on 05.04.17 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG17006886/Kea3q2-1
 
Dear	Sir	/	Madam,
	
Thank	you	for	your	email.
	
Our	respective	case	handler	will	look	into	the	matter	and	get	back	to	you	in	due	course.

mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg
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Hi	Asher,
	
Kindly	assist.
	
To	check	availability	of	the	case	handler,	you	may	contact	the	undersigned.
	
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim
related documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 26 May 2020 5:46 PM 
To: Admin A 
Cc: 'claims' 
Subject: TCS REF: AAD1704-069--Accident involving SCR333J (AXA) & SHD0178E on 05.04.17
 
Without prejudice
 
Dear Sir
 

11
SHD
178E

SCR 333J
05/04/2017

AIG 50% vivian

 
We regret to inform that we do not agree to the 50% offer.
 
Enclosed is our driver statement report for your inves�ga�on. Your client making a reverse and hit onto our taxi front
por�on.
 
Hope you can review this ma�er and let us have your best offer.
 

 
Thank You

mailto:MeiKwan@lkkauto.com
mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg


1/13/2021 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/search/id/AAQkAGVlNDlkMTdjLTM3MDgtNDY5ZC1hZTdkLWQ3ZDMyNTE0MGFhMgAQACGw4WLz5k5Tk73peJF… 4/5

Best Regards,
Ng Wai Yin
Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308
 
*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111
Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 1 November, 2018 8:14 AM 
To: 'jasminetan@transcab.com.sg' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; 'Zhe
Wei' (zhewei.kek@transcab.com.sg) <zhewei.kek@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg 
Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)
<KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Trans-Cab Bulk Se�lement on 08 Nov 2018
 
Without Prejudice
 
Hi Jasmine,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
We enclosed here with a copy of the list(50% cases) to be discussed on 08 Nov 2018.
 
Thank you.
 
“Kindly note that this nego�a�on between par�es on this ma�er is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole inten�on of resolving the

ma�er amicably without par�es resor�ng to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this

nego�a�on of terms/se�lement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of

liability/damages, either party is not bound, therea�er, by the nego�a�on terms/se�lement.”

 
 

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This email has been checked for viruses by AVG an�virus so�ware.  
www.avg.com

 

https://www.avg.com/internet-security
https://www.avg.com/internet-security
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RE: [REOPEN] Your Ref: 2606509276SG // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCR 333J AND SHD 178E ON 05/04/2017

Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>
Wed 12/16/2020 9:58 AM
To:  Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Hi Asher,
 
Case has been reopened.
 
Please proceed to reject the claim under BOLA 27.
 

 
Best Regards,
 
Bernard Ler
AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 

AIG Building
78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1946
 
Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.sg
 
 
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 15 December 2020 17:08 
To: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] [REOPEN] Your Ref: 2606509276SG // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCR 333J AND SHD 178E ON 05/04/2017
 
This message is from an external sender; be cau�ous with links and a�achments.

Your Ref: 2606509276SG

 

Hi Sir,

 

We refer to the above matter.

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCR 333J AND SHD 178E ON 05/04/2017

 

Third party have write in for settlement.

 

Kindly let us have your instruction to reopen the case in merimen for further handling.

 

Kindly advise the new handler case.

 

mailto:Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com
http://www.aig.sg/
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Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regre�ed.
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If
you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts
thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group,
Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com

