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IhH.tL.'IﬂﬂgN DatefMime: Ciomfirm with N Cromfirm by:
[Repair Cos: V& 8§ P1500.00 (L9 duys) Reduction: O\ % Email _Jcal ]
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That diem
Then] jIE

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owrer 10 Type: Company
Crwner 10 2BTEK
Vehicle Detalls
Veehicle Mo SHDITEE
Vehicle 1o oe Expories:  Yes
gu.:d-: De-registralion .. Apr 2017
Vishicls Maks CHEVROLET
Vehicle Model EFICA 20051 AT ABS DVAB 2WD 40R TURBO
Prnmary Calour: Reo
Manufacturing Year 201
Engine No Z205 1454840K
Chassis Mo KLILASSRIBE0%000

Maximum Power Qutput 1100 kW (147 bhg)
Open Markel Value: S14.281.00

Original Regatralion Date: 30 Apr 2012

First Registraton Dale: 30 Apr 2012

Trensfer Count: o

Actunl ARF Paid $14.281.00
intended PARF Rebate Detalls

PARF Eligitnlity Yas

PARF Eligibility Expiry
B 28 Apt 2020

PARF Rebale Amount  $10.710.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Data: 29 Apr 2020

COE Category! A -« Car 11600cc & bmlow)
COE Period(Years): 8

PQF Paia. S42.354.00

COE Rebate Amounl: £16.232.00
Tolal Rebate Amount: 526,942 .00

Message
Flease nots that the B-ysar COE for this vehicle canncl be further renewad. The vehicle must be deregisterad upon COE sxpiry or
when the vehicle reaches its sisfutory lifespan (il applicabie). whichever is earfier.

Tha inlormation conlaned hersin 5 comec as af 06 Ape 2017
oK

Lamd |f.|hb.‘.'#®*llflh!‘ﬂ'\

Plasss resd through the Pavacy Statenent Termms of Use and Ciaclsimer
Fieasa do nof use the Back or Forward bultons on your browsar as thin may Aoy e mauis of e IMNsachons
Bl viewed with IE €.0 EFY and above 1034 X TES nesaktion

Eopiftigtt & 2017 L6 | Tppey Stateewsy | Jeme of Uy | Dmciaesr | Bats the Websss | Rute ihis o Service

hittps:/fvr It gov sglavri/action/publunc 71D = EnquireR stateBelor eDeR eg



S1 UHIAVE 1, #0125 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ; (065) 62563361 FAX : (WS} 67414108

Our Ref: CCYHAIG1IT006886/Kwh3
17 MAY 2017

TAN SEK CHENG NANCY
16 COUNTRYSIDE VIEW
SINGAPORE 789732

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCR 333J AND SHD 178E ON 05.04.2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not setle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 29/05/2017, after we
shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis
and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Zaini
_ Case Handler
DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108
Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

ce.  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



Vic SLKKAutn! =

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 23 January, 2019 4:30 PM

To: Admin A

Cc Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Update Request for 26065092765G-003
Hi LKK,

Kindly assist to submit bill for closure since there is no development for more than 1 year.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid
78 Shenton Way #08-18 Singapore{079120)

Tel +(65) 6418 1945

Bernard-JQ Ler@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Ler, Bermmard-1Q
Sent: 19 November 2018 3:10 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: Update Request for 26065092765G-003

Hi Vivian,
Kindly assist to submit bill an this case for our closure,
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore{079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1946 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Bemard-JQ Ler@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Ler, Bermard-JQ

Sent: 24 May 2018 11:42 AM

To: 'Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: Update Request for 26065092765G-003



Dear Vivian,

As spoken, understand that we have maintained our offer of 50%. We will KIV till 3/11/2018 and will close file if
there is no further development.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore{079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1946 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Bernard-JQ Ler@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, May 24, 2018 11:30 AM

To: Ler, Bernard-JQ

Subject: RE: Update Request for 26065092765G-003

Dear Bernard,

We refer to the email below.

On 03 November 2017 during Trans cab bulk settlement, we offer TP repairer 50%, TP reject our offer .

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlan@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408913)

From: Ler, Bernard-1Q [mailto:Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com]
Sent: Thursday, 24 May, 2018 11:25 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Update Request for 26065092765G-003

Hi Vivian,

260650927656-003 | 5/4/2017 | scraza | sHp17sE | CC3/AIG17006886/KWB3




Further to the above update, may | check what is the current status? Please provide the date of latest
correspondence with TP as well,

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
Tel +(65) 6410 1946 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Bernard-JQ Ler@aig com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Byvoked | Mo setliemant

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

IM SU B |
Case | Notifiad | Est Submitted Ad) Assigned | Ag) R | Ag) Submitted | Ins Auth’ed | Satus |
t t
- 06 Apr 2017 E:g 017 $$3,000.00 $$3,000.00 IF-'llil'II for Survey
L._]"“"i - EdtAg Rpy | | o SO ll Mo | Concel Case |

Main Clalm Detalls Documants

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
Ingured- | Tan Sok Cheng Mancy, [D: S1456850C

g‘::nm: | TRANS-CABD SERVICES PTE LTD, Co. Reg, Ne.: 20030387EK

Vahicle Reg. | 0%/04/2017 18:00 - :59
No.: 'SHD178E e l[ﬂ Manths and & Diays From LTA Reg Date (Man Yri]

Claim Type: | TP / 260650927656 Polcy/COVEr | 5100317508 (Comprehensive)

_ — Mole Mo.:
Vehicle Reg.
Policy Mo,
[u;.! ] SCR331) (Claimane); | VPX/P1680520

il | —— Excess:
Repairer: Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd (Ang Mo Kio) 2, Ang Ma Kig Sireet 83, 565111 Ang Ma Kio - Tel: 62876666

Handhing AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (Express) - Tel 65-8419-3000 ., [Handled by Ler, Bernard-Q]
Ingurer: BernardhiClian Leraig com

Claimant's | ;
Misrest Im Insurance Pta Lid [HQ) - Tel: 8338 7288

Adpster: | LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 6256-3551 .. [Handled by KENNETH KONG) .. [Final Rpt due 19/04/2017]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED -

There are no mail for this case,

view il | Compose Case Man_|

View All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Comglete |
Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 22/2/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

Claim Documents

*SHD178E (26065092765G)
[SCR333)]
Ll
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
Apr 5 2017 6:40PM
[Tan Sok Cheng Nancy]
Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

Upload Documents |  upikad Photas Compose Wew Letter | Uptosd vides | upiasd Audio I View [View i Browses | ]
Mo |Finalized On | AIG Asls Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid, (SG) Thumbnall | Print|
: Accident Statament '
! 10/04717 08:20 Froume: G - Ning. hm: SCRIINL Claimant: Tﬂﬂlwm — — n Lma |
Photos/Images 3 perpage | v] E}
N |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Thumbnail | Print
1 21/82/1% 15102 | LKK INSPECTION PHOTDS 0 | Load Por |
|nuun;u:inn 1 per page w1 A
(Mo | Relabel /Heorder | LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) [ Thumbrall | Print
| |07/04/17 17:17 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED O | Loaaror
(2 |O7oa/LT 17:17 TP GIA REPORT | Load POF
13 |17/05/17 13:43 Letter Sant to O | Load POF
4 20/02/19 10:50 | EMAIL FROM AIG S | Load POF
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Aesel I 5“'] Pl"ﬂl”

Thare are no document checkdists configured.

Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants )]

Show Remarks Tor L] Handiing Insurer
Nolw: Renars iee preste unless yau show |t o ccher pertas

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 22/2/2019



Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreqne 16seor1s8m

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapora 408933

Tel. 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email' sur@lkkauto.comassignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC3IJAIG17006888/KHB3G2
Date: 221022018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer- AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Ltd.  Policy No 2100317509
E:“‘““‘ Vehicle oi0178E Insured Vehicle No : SCR333J
Date of Loss: 051042017 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 2606508276556
IPTION & | IFICATI F VEHI
Reg No- SHD178E
Make & Model: CHEVROLET EPICA, 2.0 (A) Engine No: Z2051454B48K
Reg. Date 30/04/2012 (Man. Year 2011) Chassis No: KL1LABORJBB0S2008
Colour RedWhite Odometer 689333 km
Engine Capacity 1881 cc
Markel Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S§) Market Value/New Car Price
I F I H
Genaral Condition: Steering (Serviceabla): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable) Yes Engine Modification; No Pre-acciden! Condition;
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/65 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185/65 R15
Front Left Side Gremax 7 mm Rear Left Side: Gremax & mm
Front Right Side- Gremax 7 mm Rear Right Side: Gremax & mm
Thae above valuss represan! the remaring fyre freads dephh
COST OF CLAIMS e — Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 9, 782.01 2.630.10 71519 Tan
Miscellansous [tems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 6.510.00 1.120.00 5.390.00 82.80
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 16,292.01 3,750.10 12,541.91 76.98
Approved Total (Overridden) (5%) 3,000.00
(S%) 16,292 .01 3,000.00 13,292.01 8158
+ GS5T 7.00/7.00% (S$) 1.140 44 210.00 930.44 81.58
Nett Amount (S$) 17.432.45 3,210.00 14,222.45 81.59
Global Sum Settlemant (S§) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: DB/04/2017
Date Inspected DB/04/2017 Inspected AL Trans-cab Auto Services Ple Lid (Ang Mo

Estimated Pernod of Repair:

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen _...

2.5 days

Kio)
2, Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 589111

22/2/2019



Adjuster Repont Page 2 of' 4

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE. This report represents our fogings of ine ima and place of ingpectian staled herein. Such nspection has boen carmed oul o (e best of our
knowledpe and ablity bt any ather Babilily undar any other circumatances i hersby expresaly excluged

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 22/2/2019



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Oty Parli No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Cracked 1,202.00FL *1,20200FL
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER LOWER ABSORBER Cracked 180,00 FL *160,00 FL
3 1 *FRONT EUMPER REINFORCEMENT Repair 358,00 FL *.FL
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER RETAINER RH Distorted 102.00 FL "02.00FL
5 1 *FRONT BEUMPER RETAINER LH Distoried 102.00 FL *102.00 FL
B8 1 *FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE Serviceabls 78.00 FL *-FL
7 1 *FRONT BUMPER LOWER STIFFEMER Repair 134.37FL ~FL
8 1 *BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER RH Serviceable 32.40FL ~FL
1] 1 *BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER LH Serviceable 3240FL *-FL
10 1 *FRONT FENDER RH Repair 83760FL *FL
11 1 *FRONT FENDER LH Repair B37BOFL *-FL
12 1 *FRONT FENDER LINER RH Serviceable 47.00FL *FL
13 1 *FRONT FENDER LINER LH Serviceabls 47 .00FL *-FL
14 1 *BONNET Repair 1,250.00 FL *-FL
15 1 *BONNET MOULDING Serviceable 161.97FL *-FL
68 1 *BONNET HINGE RH Repair 36.00FL *-FL
17 01 *BONMNET HINGE LH Repair 36.00FL *.FL
18 1 *CENTR LOGO BADGE MNecessary 60,00 FL *60.00 FL
19 1 *FRONT SUPPORT PANEL ASSY Repair 1.222.32FL *-FL
20 1 *HEADLAMP RH Serviceable 816.00FL *FL
21 1 *HEADLAMP LH Mig Cracked 816.00 FL "H16.00 FL
2 1 *RADIATOR GRILLE (GRILLE A-RAD) Cracked 3687.00FL *367.00FL
22 1 *RADIATOR GRILLE TOP COVER Serviceable 4502 FL *.FL
24 1 *FAN BLADE (AC) Serviceable 536.00FL *FL
25 1 *AIR INTERCOOLER Serviceable 852 00FL ~FL
28 1 *AIRCON CONDENSER Serviceable B00.00FL *-FL
ar 1 *SET FRONT BUMPER FASTENER CLIP Mecessary 24 00FS 24 00FS
28 1 *SET RADIATOR GRILLE TOP COVER CLIP Not Necessary 10.00FS “.Fs
2 1 *SET FRONT LICENCE PLATE WITH HOLDER Dented BO.ODFS *25.00FS
I 1 *SET RADIATOR GRILLE CLIP MNecessary 35.00FSs *35.00FS
S | *SET FRONT FENDER LINER CLIP LH Not Necessary 30.00Fs *-F5
Z 1 *SET FRONT FENDER LINER CLIP RH Mol Necessary 30.00FS *Fs5
33 1 *SET LOUVEL COWL TOP CLIP Nol Necessary 30.00Fs *~FS
M 2 *BONNET STOPPER Mot Necessary 15.00FS “FS
FaFranchise pan. S=SpcNetl. L=ListiamDisc
Sub Total (S5%) 10,840.68 2,913.00
- List ltem Discount on L ltems 10.00/10.00% (S%) 1,05867 282.90
Total Parts (S§)  9,782.01 2,630.10
Report was unsubmitied during this print-out |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 22/2/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

Thare are no now misceilansous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repalrer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO CHECK ELECTRICAL LIGHTING CONCERNED New 170.00 20.00
2  PANEL BEATING KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE New 2,700.00 500.00
NECESSARY PORTION,REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME
3 PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTE PORTION MNew 2,800.00 600.00
TO REPLACE ,REFIX AND TOP UP COOLANT FOR RADIATOR  New 170.00 0.00
TO DISMANTLE AND REFIT AIRCON ASSY AND New 380.00 0.00
ATTACHMENT ,VACUUM AND CHARGE-IN-GAS
6  TO RUST-PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS New 170.00 0.00
7  TOWING FEES New 120.00 0.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 6,510.00 1.120.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 22/2/2019



