Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 23 November 2020 12:59 PM

To: '‘Rachel Wu'; assignments; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); CS A Team

Cc: Admin A; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: MSFCIL: D20002231MFSH/CTPL/SHD7208G DOA 26-05-2020 TP REF: SMP7358)

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for the email.
Dear Cecilia,

Kindly assist.

FYNA Our Ref : CC4/FCI20005961/Aga3

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 23 November, 2020 12:11 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto
<Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: MSFCIL: D20002231MFSH/CTPL/SHD7208G DOA 26-05-2020 TP REF: SMP7358)

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Kindly let us have your survey report and invoice.
Thank you

Best Regards

Rachel Wu
Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3862
| Fax No. : 6507 3849 |[Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg [Company Regn. No. 195000106C
A Member of Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):



