Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 June 2020 10:59 AM

To: Admin A; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 5922 G & SGG 2581 G ON 25 MAY 2020 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Attachments: SKR5922G_estimate_finalisation.pdf; SKR5922G_invoice.pdf; SKR5922G_report.PDF;

SGG2581G_ins_search.pdf

Your Ref:
Our Ref : SKR 5922 G

17 June 2020

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM

8 Shenton Way (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#27-01 TO: Any Personal Injury
AXA Tower Claims)

Singapore 068811

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,

#02-25

Singapore 408933

Attn: Claims Department
Dear Sir/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 5922 G & SGG 2581 G ON 25 MAY 2020 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Kindly find attached the finalized report for SKR 5922 G, as proposed by our Single Joint Expert. We are pleased to
inform that we are agreeable to the amount proposed.

As such, we are writing to your kind office to call for a direct settlement, in relation to the accident involving SKR
5922 G & SGG 2581 G on 25 May 2020. We will like to know if your company is prepared to settle for the amount as
stated below:

Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SJE) :$ 4,100.00

Loss of Use (repair days as proposed by SJE) :$  720.00 ($240/day X 3 days)
Loss of Use (for PRI from 26/05/2020 to 27/05/2020) $ 240.00 ($240/day X 1 day)
LTA Search  $ 7.45

Total: : $5,067.45

We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within the next
7 days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury claims), if
required, so that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.

We have also attached a copy of our company’s invoice for SKR 5922 G, the Singapore Accident Statement of SKR
5922 G and LTA search for your easy reference.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1% June 2019, we have shifted to and are now operating
from the following address:



37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 27, 2020 9:52 AM

To: AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>; customer.service@axa.com.sg
<customer.service@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 5922 G & SGG 2581 G ON 25 MAY 2020 - APPOINTMENT OF LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT

Your Ref:
Our Ref: SKR 5922 G

27 May 2020

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM
8 Shenton Way (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#27-01 TO: Any Personal Injury
AXA Tower Claims)

Singapore 068811

Attn: Claims Department Via Email

Dear Sir/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 5922 G & SGG 2581 G ON 25 MAY 2020 - APPOINTMENT OF LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT

Thank you so much for your reply dated 27 May 2020. We are pleased to inform you that we are agreeable to your
selection of LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd as the Single Joint Expert.

In compliance with the New State Courts Practice Directions, we shall await your kind office to instruct LKK Auto
Consultants Pte Ltd (as the Single Joint Expert) to attend to the pre-repair survey of our client's damaged vehicle
at our premise at 15 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-05/53 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417808.

We seek your assistance in arranging for the pre-repair survey by 29 May 2020 (Friday), 1000H so that we can
commence repair on our client's damaged vehicle as soon as possible and expedite the return of the vehicle to our
client.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.



