Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 June 2020 3:35 PM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 5922 G & SGG 2581 G ON 25 MAY 2020 - CALL FOR

DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your email.

We propose a settlement at a global sum of $4,400.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 June 2020 10:59 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 5922 G & SGG 2581 G ON 25 MAY 2020 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Your Ref:

Our Ref : SKR 5922 G

17 June 2020

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM
8 Shenton Way (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#27-01 TO: Any Personal Injury

AXA Tower Claims)



Singapore 068811

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,

#02-25

Singapore 408933

Attn: Claims Department

Dear Sir/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 5922 G & SGG 2581 G ON 25 MAY 2020 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Kindly find attached the finalized report for SKR 5922 G, as proposed by our Single Joint Expert. We are pleased to
inform that we are agreeable to the amount proposed.

As such, we are writing to your kind office to call for a direct settlement, in relation to the accident involving SKR
5922 G & SGG 2581 G on 25 May 2020. We will like to know if your company is prepared to settle for the amount as
stated below:

Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SJE) :$ 4,100.00
Loss of Use (repair days as proposed by SJE) :$  720.00 ($240/day X 3 days)
Loss of Use (for PRI from 26/05/2020 to 27/05/2020) $  240.00 ($240/day X 1 day)

LTA Search  $ 7.45

Total: : $5,067.45

We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within the next
7 days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury claims), if
required, so that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.
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