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RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] TIMEBAR // CASE Your Ref: C0316295 // ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SGW 5865J AND SKN 4949H ON 10/09/2014

WANG Peter <peter.wang@axa.com.sg>
Thu 9/24/2020 1:45 PM
To:  Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  NG Stacey <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg>

 
Dear Asher
 
Thank you for the swi� response.
 
As spoken just now, please proceed to se�le at 10% with quantum as proposed. A�erwards, you may submit the
signed se�lement form and your supplementary adjuster’s invoice via email.
 
Meanwhile, you men�oned that you already forwarded the pre- and post- repair photos to our previous handlers,
but I was unable to locate it in our file. Please assist to resend me a copy via email as well. Thank you!
 
 
Regards
 
Peter Wang | Specialist, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811
Email: peter.wang@axa.com.sg
www.axa.com.sg

 
We remain available to serve you during the circuit breaker period. For AXA’s COVID—19 updates & ini�a�ves,
please visit h�ps://www.axa.com.sg/covid-19-updates .
 
Please consider the environment before prin�ng this message 
This message is confiden�al. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemina�on, either whole or par�al, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please no�fy the sender immediately.
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, September 24, 2020 1:21 PM 
To: WANG Peter <peter.wang@axa.com.sg> 
Cc: NG Stacey <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: [MANDATE REQUEST] TIMEBAR // CASE Your Ref: C0316295 // ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SGW 5865J AND SKN 4949H ON 10/09/2014
 
Hi Peter,
 
We refer to the email below.
 
Tried to call you however unable to reach you.
 
Our proposed amount based on 10% of the third party total se�lement.
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Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 

From: WANG Peter <peter.wang@axa.com.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, September 24, 2020 11:54 AM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: NG Stacey <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] TIMEBAR // CASE Your Ref: C0316295 // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGW 5865J AND
SKN 4949H ON 10/09/2014
 
 
Dear Asher
 
Please clarify on how you derived the se�lement proposal at $ 429.29 (all-in). I was unable to find the breakdown
in the a�ached documents.
 
Feel free to call me at 68804393 so we can wrap up the ma�er. Thank you!
 
 
Regards
 
Peter Wang | Specialist, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811
Email: peter.wang@axa.com.sg
www.axa.com.sg

 
We remain available to serve you during the circuit breaker period. For AXA’s COVID—19 updates & ini�a�ves,
please visit h�ps://www.axa.com.sg/covid-19-updates .
 
Please consider the environment before prin�ng this message 
This message is confiden�al. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemina�on, either whole or par�al, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please no�fy the sender immediately.
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, September 4, 2020 10:23 AM 
To: NG Stacey <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg>; WANG Peter <peter.wang@axa.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: [MANDATE REQUEST] TIMEBAR // CASE Your Ref: C0316295 // ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SGW 5865J AND SKN 4949H ON 10/09/2014
 
Hi Sir,
 
We refer to the email dated on 25/06/20.
 
Third party is chasing for offer / se�lement.
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruc�on if any.
 
Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

mailto:peter.wang@axa.com.sg
mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 

From: NG Stacey <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg> 
Sent: Friday, June 26, 2020 5:42 PM 
To: WANG Peter <peter.wang@axa.com.sg> 
Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: [MANDATE REQUEST] TIMEBAR // CASE Your Ref: C0316295 // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGW 5865J
AND SKN 4949H ON 10/09/2014
 
Dear Peter,
 
Please assist.
 
Thank you.
 
Regards
 
___________________________________________________ 
Stacey Ng | Manager, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email:stacey.ng@axa.com.sg
Customer Care No. 1800 8804888
 
We remain available to serve you during the circuit breaker period. For AXA’s COVID-19 updates & ini�a�ves,
please visit h�ps://www.axa.com.sg/covid-19-updates.
     
 
Please consider the environment before prin�ng this message 
This message is confiden�al. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemina�on, either whole or par�al, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please no�fy the sender immediately.
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, June 25, 2020 11:11 PM 
To: NG Stacey <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] [MANDATE REQUEST] TIMEBAR // CASE Your Ref: C0316295 // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGW
5865J AND SKN 4949H ON 10/09/2014
 

Your Ref: C0316295

 

Dear Sirs,

 

We refer to the above matter.

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
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The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the 2nd  vehicle and the last vehicle
malaysian vehicle

 

Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at
10% liability.

 

We seek your approval to offer repairer " MBM WHEELPOWER PTE LTD" at $ 429.29 (all-in).

 

Enclosed the supporting document submitted from that third party.

 

For your approval please.

 
Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 

-----Disclaimer----- 
This message may contain confiden�al informa�on intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you
have received this message by mistake, please no�fy the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in
this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or
any other en�ty of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said
companies.
-----Disclaimer----- 
This message may contain confiden�al informa�on intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you
have received this message by mistake, please no�fy the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in
this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or
any other en�ty of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said
companies.
This message is confiden�al; its contents do not cons�tute a commitment by  
AXA except where provided for in a wri�en agreement between you and AXA. Any  
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemina�on, either whole or par�al, is  
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prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please no�fy  
the sender immediately.
-----Disclaimer----- 
This message may contain confiden�al informa�on intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you
have received this message by mistake, please no�fy the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in
this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or
any other en�ty of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said
companies.
-----Disclaimer----- 
This message may contain confiden�al informa�on intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you
have received this message by mistake, please no�fy the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in
this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or
any other en�ty of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said
companies.
This message is confiden�al; its contents do not cons�tute a commitment by  
AXA except where provided for in a wri�en agreement between you and AXA. Any  
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemina�on, either whole or par�al, is  
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please no�fy  
the sender immediately.
-----Disclaimer----- 
This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named
addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the
content of this message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender
immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this message are solely those of the author and do
not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless
otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.
-----Disclaimer----- 
This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named
addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the
content of this message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender
immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this message are solely those of the author and do
not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless
otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by  
AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any  
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is  
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify  
the sender immediately. 


