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Re: Accident involving FBG8259H & SJJ4515J on 2 May 2020 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20005913/Upa3

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sat 9/1/2021 12:23 PM
To:  raymond@bhh.com.sg <raymond@bhh.com.sg>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Without Prejudice

Dear Raymond,

We refer to the above ma�er.

We confirm se�lement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 1,498.00
2. Loss of Use (5days x $20.00) $    100.00

Total $ 1,598.00

Kindly provide a copy of LOD cover le�er for our necessary ac�on. Thanks.

“Kindly note that this nego�a�on between par�es on this ma�er is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole inten�on of resolving the ma�er amicably without par�es resor�ng to legal

proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this nego�a�on of terms/se�lement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, therea�er, by the

nego�a�on terms/se�lement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: raymond@bhh.com.sg <raymond@bhh.com.sg> 
Sent: Tuesday, 29 December 2020 10:45 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: Accident involving FBG8259H & SJJ4515J on 2 May 2020 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20005913/Uka3
 
Dear Khanchna,
 
We refer to our email dated 04/12/2020.
 
Appreciate for you to advise the payment status of the above third party claim direct se�lement.
 
Thanks 

Best Regards, 
Raymond 
Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd 
Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969 

Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg  
Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg
 

 
 
 
From: raymond@bhh.com.sg <raymond@bhh.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 4 December 2020 2:39 PM 
To: 'Khanchna (LKK Auto)' <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; 'hasrianah@bhh.com.sg' <hasrianah@bhh.com.sg> 
Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involving FBG8259H & SJJ4515J on 2 May 2020 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20005913/Uka3
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Dear Khanchna,
 
We attached the signed Letter of Authorisation, Release Voucher and Repair Bill for your perusal.
 
Appreciate for you to arrange payment as soon as possible.
 
Thanks

Best Regards, 
Raymond 
Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd 
Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969 

Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg  
Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg
 

 
 
 
From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 8 June 2020 11:35 AM 
To: hasrianah@bhh.com.sg 
Cc: raymond@bhh.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involving FBG8259H & SJJ4515J on 2 May 2020 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20005913/Uka3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Madam,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline
settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.
 
Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your client’s vehicle.
 
The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident.
 
And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.
 
Please note that all finalisation subject insurer’s approval.
 
“Kindly note that this nego�a�on between par�es on this ma�er is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole inten�on of resolving the ma�er amicably without par�es resor�ng to legal
proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this nego�a�on of terms/se�lement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, therea�er, by the
nego�a�on terms/se�lement.”
 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in
softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
 
 
Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
 
 
 

From: hasrianah@bhh.com.sg <hasrianah@bhh.com.sg>  
Sent: Saturday, June 6, 2020 11:33 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: raymond@bhh.com.sg 
Subject: RE: Accident involving FBG8259H & SJJ4515J on 2 May 2020 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20005913/Uka3
 
Dear Khanchna
 
We refer to our email dated 26/05/2020.
 
Appreciate for you to advise your insured liability for direct settlement.
 
 
Thank you.
 
Best Regards, 
Hasrianah 

Insurance Department 
Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd 
Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 222 | Fax:(65) 6281 2830 

Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg  
Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg 
 

 
 
 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 27 May 2020 9:29 PM 
To: raymond@bhh.com.sg; Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: hasrianah@bhh.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involving FBG8259H & SJJ4515J on 2 May 2020 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20005913/Uka3
 
Dear Sir / Madam,
 
Thank you for your email.
	
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
 
Hi	Khanchna,
	
Kindly	assist.
	
To	check	availability	of	the	case	handler,	you	may	contact	the	undersigned.
	
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in
softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
 

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: raymond@bhh.com.sg [mailto:raymond@bhh.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 26 May 2020 2:43 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) 
Cc: hasrianah@bhh.com.sg 
Subject: Accident involving FBG8259H & SJJ4515J on 2 May 2020
 
Dear Mei Kwan,
 
Mr. Marcus has surveyed our customer bike at our workshop this morning.
 
Appreciate for you to advise your insured liability for direct settlement.
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Thanks

Best Regards, 
Raymond 
Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd 
Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969 

Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg  
Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg
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