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RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SML991Y AND SML1078C ON 07/02/2020

From: Lee, Ming-Yao

To: assignments, Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc:

Sent: Monday, 6 July, 2020 3:33:10 PM

Hi Team,

We have reached settlement of this case.

Please proceed to close the file.

Regards,

Lee Ming Yao, George

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1769

Ming-Yao.Lee@AIG.com | www.aig.sg

From: Chin, Lee­Ying <Lee­Ying.Chin@aig.com> 

Sent: 11 February 2020 10:44

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin­D (LKKAuto) <admin­d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Lim, Kok­Chong <Kok­Chong.Lim@aig.com>

Subject: aigencrypt PRE­REPAIR INSPECTION ­ ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SML991Y AND SML1078C ON 07/02/2020

 Hi LKK,

Kindly assist to survey.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Lee Ying, Chin

AIG

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08­16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1947

Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com | www.aig.sg
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