Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Cecilia,

Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>
Tuesday, 28 July 2020 11:56 AM

Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Admin A

Chong Fei Yuan (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto
Svcs/Claims & I1A/Claims & |1A/Buses)

RE: OUR REF:BUS/05/20/1008 - ACCIDENT ON 14/05/20 INVOLVING SMB1448X AND
SLB6557T ALONG SCOTTS ROAD SLIP ROAD AND ORCHARD ROAD BEFORE BS:09047
(ORCHARD STATION/TANG PLAZA)

Thank you for your G/S offer but regret that we are unable to accept.
Purely for an amicable settlement, kindly assist to conclude the matter as follows:-

Cost of repair $ 4,000.00
Loss of use (4 days @ $250.00/day) $ 1,000.00
LTA search fee $7.00

Total $5007.00

Do let us have your DV if there is a settlement, thanks.

Regards,

Patirick Towv

Claims and Insurance Agency

Direct line +65 6556 3522 | tanweiteck@smrt.com.sg

6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62
Singapore 569140

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2020 10:07 AM

To: Ong Hua Yen (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses); Admin A

Cc: Chong Fei Yuan (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA); Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims &
IA/Buses); Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims &

IA/Claims & IA/Buses)

Subject: RE: OUR REF:BUS/05/20/1008 - ACCIDENT ON 14/05/20 INVOLVING SMB1448X AND SLB6557T ALONG
SCOTTS ROAD SLIP ROAD AND ORCHARD ROAD BEFORE BS:09047 (ORCHARD STATION/TANG PLAZA)

2\° REMINDER

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Hua Yen,

We are pleased to offer G/S $4750.00 (all-in).



Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LIRS
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From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 21 July 2020 2:04 PM

To: 'Ong Hua Yen (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)' <OngHuaYen@smrt.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chong Fei Yuan (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) <FeiYuan@smrt.com.sg>; Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto
Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <BalgishBAH@smrt.com.sg>; Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims &
IA/Buses) <TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>; Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)
<ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OUR REF:BUS/05/20/1008 - ACCIDENT ON 14/05/20 INVOLVING SMB1448X AND SLB6557T ALONG SCOTTS
ROAD SLIP ROAD AND ORCHARD ROAD BEFORE BS:09047 (ORCHARD STATION/TANG PLAZA)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Hua Yen,

We are pleased to offer G/S $4750.00 (all-in).
Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

2



