Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 July 2020 5:59 PM
To: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto)

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Billing for TRC 4244H

Bill 350/-

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 July 2020 3:13 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Billing for TRC 4244H

Hello Bryan

How much do we bill AXA for the tyre investigation report of trailer TRC 4244H?

Best Regards,
Sherwin Beh | Technical Investigator
LKK Auto Consultants

Office: 6256 3561 | Email: SherwinBeh@]lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)



