Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: 28 August 2020 11:37 AM

To: ADEBEN.LIM@GMAIL.COM

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCN8339L & YN8226T ALONG/AT NAMLY PLACE ON
16/05/2020

Our Ref: CC4/A1G20005791/ka3

ADELINE LIM
[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCN8339L & YN8226T ALONG/AT NAMLY PLACE ON 16/05/2020

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour. We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles)
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call/e-mail us if you have further queries.

c.cC. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: 2 September 2020 3:39 PM

To: Lee, Ming-Yao

Cc: Admin A

Subject: YOUR REF: TP / 5510192692SG - ACCIDENT BETWEEN YN 8226T & SCN 8339L (AIG)
ON 16/05/2020

Attachments: EMAIL FROM TP REPAIRER.pdf

AIG REF: TP / 55101926925G

Dear Mr. George,

We refer to the above matter and attachments herein.

Please be informed that the third party had withdrawn the claim.
As such, we will proceed to close without invoice as no survey done.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>

Sent: 2 September 2020 2:27 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: RE: Urgent: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your vehicle SCN8339L; Our vehicle YN8226T
Accident involving YN8226T & SCN8339L On 16 May 2020 *** LKK REF:
CC4/A1G20005791/ka3

Dear Khanchna,

We had abandoned the claim.
Thank you

Best regards

Orson

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 22 AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921
Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277

I

On Tue, Sep 1, 2020 at 10:47 AM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear June,

Please confirm whether your client is pursuing any claim or not because

our Insured said that your client told her that they are not making any claim.

Thank you.



