Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 June 2020 11:19 AM
To: ‘Richmond Ho'

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Final Bill For SMG7006Y

Hi Richmond,

COR $17,119.64, 12 days.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Richmond Ho [mailto:richmond.ho@wearnes.com]
Sent: Thursday, 18 June 2020 2:55 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Final Bill For SMG7006Y

Importance: High

Hi Taufikh

Please see attached for the final bill. Total 12 working days

Richmond Ho
Senior Service Consultant
Body & Paint — Insurance Claim

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
—w_ 249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935
D (65) 6430 4890 M (65) 9176 8543
WEARMNES www.wearnesauto.com  richmond.ho@wearnes.com
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