Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 February, 2017 9:43 AM

To: Jas Khine (LKKAuto); Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Angie Foo; Alfred Toh; Susan Teo; KKLau; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SFA6450T (SNM16D01850C02/0) and
SJW4950S (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI16008255/Aya3) on 27.04.2016

Attachments: TP VEH INSPECTION PHOTOS.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Without Prejudice

LKK REF - CC6/CT116008255/Aya3
CTl REF-SNM16D01850C02/0

Dear Jas

We refer to your email and reminders pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to reject the property damage claim on our behalf.

Aside to Angie, please check on the status of Insured’s claim against SJW4950S.

Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd

3 Anson Road

#15-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID : +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7175/6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sq.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sq.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sqg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided
for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination,
either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) [mailto:jaskhine@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, February 13, 2017 7:04 PM

To: Angie Foo

Cc: Alfred Toh; Claims Dept of CTI

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SFA6450T (SNM16D01850C02/0) and SJW4950S (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CT116008255/Aya3) on 27.04.2016



Dear Angie,
We refer to our email dated 25/10/2016.
Kindly advice your instruction on an urgent basis as TP repairer keeps chasing us for liability and settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 December, 2016 1:28 PM

To: 'angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com' <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: 'alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hwang Shiang Yi
(shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com) <shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SFA6450T (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SJW4950S (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CT116008255/Aya3) on 27.04.2016

Dear Angie,
Further to the below matter.
We would like to follow up our email as TP repairer keeps chasing us for liability and settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 October, 2016 3:01 PM

To: 'Angie Foo' <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hwang Shiang Yi
(shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com) <shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SFA6450T (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SJIW4950S (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CT116008255/Aya3) on 27.04.2016

Dear Angie,
Further to the below matter.

We have spoken with Ol company in-charged Mr Kishore and were informed that their counter claim against TP
insurer have yet settle up to date.



We have requested Third Party to provide substantial evidence to support their claim. However, the claimant unable
to provide any evidence.

Based on the circumstances of the accident and damage profile of both vehicles, we are of the opinion that TP
vehicle hit onto our insured vehicle’s rear right porting when his vehicle swerve to the right to avoid hitting Ol
vehicle while Ol vehicle made a sudden break and resulted still hit onto Ol vehicle rear right corner.

Since TP unable to provide substantial evidence to support their version, we are intending to reject TP claim.
Kindly advise your instruction/approval/comments if any.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Angie Foo [mailto:angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 10 May, 2016 6:19 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Vic <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKK Auto) <jaskhine@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>;
Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SFA6450T (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SJW4950S (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CT116008255/Aya3) on 27.04.2016

YR REF:(TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI116008255/Aya3)
OUR REF: SNM16D01850C02/LKKDS/0

Dear Mei Kwan/Jas,
We refer to your email of 6™ May 2016.
We attached a copy of our assignment letter and Insured’s SAS Report for your necessary action.

Please be advised that third party hit onto our Insured’s rear portion and our Insured is claiming against Third Party.
Thank you.

Regards,

Angie Foo

Executive

Motor Division

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909
Co.Reg.N0.200208384E

DID: 6389 6186

Fax: 6224 7478 /6224 7175

Email: angie.foo@sg.cntaiping,com
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com




Disclaimer:

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided for in a
written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 6 May, 2016 1:38 PM

To: Angie Foo

Cc: Disk Yao; Alfred Toh; Hwang Shiang Yi; Claims Dept of CTl; KKLau; Vic; Jas Khine (LKK Auto); Admin A
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SFA6450T (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SJW4950S (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI116008255/Aya3) on 27.04.2016

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected the vehicle SJW 4950S at M/s New Hock Teck Motor
Workshop - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed herewith a copy of TP’s GIA report for your perusal.

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report and claim reference for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jas and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2928.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




