Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 May, 2020 2:30 PM

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto)

Cc: SUR; Justin Wong

Subject: Fw: REQUEST FOR PRI SURVEY SLS419J || C10006295
Attachments: SLD8477S.pdf; SLS419).pdf

Hi Team,

We would like to arrange TP PRS for SLS419J. TP has chosen Mr. Kenneth Kong to survey this vehicle.

Workshop information:

Esteem Performance Pte Ltd

Address :385 SIN MING DRIVE (S) 575718 (INSIDE VICOM)
Tel : 6566 2112

Fax : 6259 3326

Please confirm. Thank you.

Regards,

Ivy Ratilla
Executive, Claims Admin

T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853
Eivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.sg

From: serence ctc <serence@esteemperf.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 May 2020 14:22

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Carmen Lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>; Justin Wong <justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Subject: Re: REQUEST FOR PRI SURVEY SLS419J || C10006295



Dear Sir/madam,
We prefer Mr. Kenneth Kong (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) to survey the car

Thanks

Freundliche GriiBe / Best Regards

Serence Chee
Claims Assistant | Operation Division

Esteem Performance Pte Ltd

P: 6566 2112
E: serence@esteemperf.com.sg

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259
(Head Office)

385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection Centre
(Showroom)

www.esteemperformance.com

From: serence ctc <serence@esteemperf.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 13 May 2020 13:52

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Carmen Lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>
Subject: REQUEST FOR PRI SURVEY SLS419)

Dear Sir / Madam

NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS
PURSUANT TO PRE-ACTION PROTOCOAL FOR NON INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT CASES
(NIMA)

We act for Grab Rentals Pte Ltd who has appointed the under-mentioned workshop to repair his
motor vehicle no.SLS 419 J

Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at :
Name of workshop : Esteem Performance Pte Ltd
Address :385 SIN MING DRIVE (S) 575718 (INSIDE VICOM)

Tel : 6566 2112
Fax : 6259 3326

We hereby give 2 clear days notice to conduct a pre-repair inspection of the said vehicle at the
above-mentioned workshop during office hours.



If you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 working days excluding any
intervening Saturday, Sunday or Public Holiday. The above-mentioned workshop will commence
repairs should you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection.

Thank you

Freundliche GriiBe / Best Regards

Serence Chee
Claims Assistant | Operation Division

Esteem Performance Pte Ltd

P: 6566 2112
E: serence@esteemperf.com.sg

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259
(Head Office)

385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection Centre
(Showroom)

www.esteemperformance.com
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