
Your Ref :
Our Ref  : CIV1303331 / GBH 3225 H Date : 05-09-20

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road
#17-00 Tower Block,
MND Complex,
Singapore 069110
RE           : ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 3225 H & GBH 7326 Z

ACCIDENT DATE 
ACCIDENT ALONG SENOKO DRIVE

We are the workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no : which was involved in the
captioned accident. The vehicle was surveyed by an independent appraiser and the claims below are based 
on its recommendation sum being for the repair cost and the period of repair (Strictly on a Without Prejudice
Basis)

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured we are submitting these
claims for your consideration.  

1 Cost of repair S $ 11,413.68
2 Loss of use   18 days @ $ 150 / day S $ 2,700.00

2 days to arrange PRI
14 days
2 days

Total : 18 days
5 LTA Fee S $ 7.45
6 Additional Towing bill add on S $ 74.90

S $ 14,196.03

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:-  

a) Authorization letter
b) Final repair bill(s)
c) LTA search
d) GIA report(s) / result
e) Insurance certificate,etc……

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our client’s claim as soon as
possible. Thank you.

Yours faithfully

Carmen Lim
Claims Executive

DM20HO00800/SG

GBH 7326 Z

GBH 3225 H

08.05.2020

Recommend :

DOA : 07.11.2019
PRI Request : 07.11.2019 @ 12:27
Survey Date : 08.11.2019

Weekend : 17.05.2020 & 24.05.2020











Our Ref: CC4/EQI20005707/Kka3 
 
 
20 JULY 2020 
 
DELI ASIA (S) PTE LTD 
15 SENOKO DRIVE  
#05-06  
JTC FOOD HUB @ SENOKO  
SINGAPORE 758202 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 3225H & GBH 7326Z ON 08/05/2020 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster 
appointed by your motor insurer, EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED to deal 
with the third party claim against your insurance policy. 
  
Based on the accident reports and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is 
not in your favour. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement 
with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and 
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. 
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this 
claim and your NCD will be protected.  
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 

Khanchna  
Case Handler  
DID: 6841 2360  
FAX: 6741 4108  
EMAIL: khanchna@lkkauto.com 
 
c.c. EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED  
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
  



1

Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Janice Goh <janice.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 21 December 2020 9:29 AM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRI SURVEY GBH3225H - EQ's REF: DM20HO00800/SG

Hi Cecilia 
 
Please proceed. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Announcement 
 
In line with the Safe Re-opening measures, our operation remains “Business As Usual” – except most of us are on a Work-From-Home arrangement -reachable by phone or email or an arranged video call meeting. 

 
Our Customer Care Counter will remain closed until further notice. Any onsite customer care service, including meetings in the EQI premises can only be conducted on a prior a
 
Regards  
 
Janice Goh 
Executive | Claims  

  
To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
EQ Logo

 

  

EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  
To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
EQ Pen

          

 

did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190 
www.eqinsurance.com.sg         
  

To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
A Member Of Citystate

 

  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.        
 

 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Monday, December 14, 2020 5:57 PM 
To: Janice Goh <janice.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg> 
Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRI SURVEY GBH3225H - EQ's REF: DM20HO00800/SG 
 

EQ ref : DM20HO00800/SG 

LKK ref : CC4/EQI20005707/Kga3q2      

Dear Sirs/Madam, 
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 ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 7326Z(EQ-OI) AND GBH 3225H   (TP) ON 08/05/2020       

 We refer to the above matter. 

 This is a head-to-rear collision. 

A letter was sent out to the Insured to notify Third Party claim and NCD issues. No further feedback till to date. 

 We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer “ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTE LTD” at 13,291.13(all-in). 

  

The summary is as follows: - 

  

  Claimed 
Amount 

Revised Amount   

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 14,295.15 $ 11,413.68   
2. Loss of Use (18days x $150.00) $   2,700.00 $   1,800.00 (18days x $100.00)   
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $         7.45 $         7.45   
4. TOWING FEE $       74.90 $       70.00   

Total $ 17,077.50 $ 13,291.13   

  

**14days recommendation for repair + 2Sunday + 2PRS = 18days 

  

Market Value : $42,000.00 (est) 
LTA Rebate : $27,335.00 (est) 
Nett Value : $14,665.00 (est) 

  

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 

  

Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. 

 
 
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Carmen Lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 29 December 2020 9:30 AM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: jenny chong
Subject: Re: YOUR REF: GBH 3225H (OUR REF: CC4/EQI20005707/Kga3q2) *** ACCIDENT 

INVOVLING GBH 7326Z & GBH 3225H ON 08/05/2020 ***

Dear Cecilia, 
 
We accept your offer at $12,550/- to settle property claims only. 
 
Kindly let us have your DV asap. 
 
Thank you  
 
 
 

To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 

Freundliche Grüße / Best Regards 

 

Carmen Lim 

Accident Claim Executive | Operation 

Division 

Esteem Performance Pte Ltd 

M: 8799 0066 
P: 6484 1221 
E: carmen@esteemperf.com.sg 

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259 
(Head Office) 
385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection 
Centre (Showroom) 

www.esteemperformance.com  
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On Tue, Dec 22, 2020 at 11:45 AM Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Carmen, 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Carmen Lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 29 December 2020 2:27 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: jenny chong
Subject: Re: YOUR REF: GBH 3225H (OUR REF: CC4/EQI20005707/Kga3q2) *** ACCIDENT 

INVOVLING GBH 7326Z & GBH 3225H ON 08/05/2020 ***

Dear Cecilia, 
 
Pls refer bank account details as below :- 
 

  

Account 
Name 

ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTE LTD 

Account 
Number 

  
441-300112-3 

 

Bank 
Name 

UOB Ltd 
 

Bank & 
Branch 
Code 

  
7375  (BANK CODE)  
441 (BRANCH CODE) 

  

  
  
 
 
 
 
 

To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 

Freundliche Grüße / Best Regards 

 

Carmen Lim 

Accident Claim Executive | Operation 

Division 

Esteem Performance Pte Ltd 

M: 8799 0066 
P: 6484 1221 
E: carmen@esteemperf.com.sg 

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259 
(Head Office) 
385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection 
Centre (Showroom) 


