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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 11 May 2020 12:25 PM

To: Stanley Lai; Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: Claims; Hansel Ang

Subject: RE: BUDGET DIRECT Claim: C10006289 || ACCD INVL SML9408G & SGQ1697K ON 

07/05/2020, PRE REPAIR  INSPECTIONS FOR SML9408G 

Dear Stanley, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: Stanley Lai <stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 11 May 2020 12:03 PM 

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Hansel Ang <hansel.ang@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: BUDGET DIRECT Claim: C10006289 || ACCD INVL SML9408G & SGQ1697K ON 07/05/2020, PRE REPAIR 

INSPECTIONS FOR SML9408G  

 

Dear Summer / Nivitha, 

 

We wish to appoint LKK to do PRS for TP vehicle SML9408G on a without prejudice basis. 

 

Please find the attached PRS notice and TP GIA report for your reference. 

 

Kindly note that our insured had yet to report the accident. 

 

Thank you 

 

Regards, 

  

Stanley Lai 

Executive, Claims 
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T +65 6540 2189 

F +65 6725 0853  

E stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg 

  

The linked 
image cannot 
be d isplayed.  
The file may  
have been 
mov ed, 
renamed, or  
deleted. 

Verify that  
the link 
points to the  
correct file  
and location. 

The linked 
image cannot 
be d isplayed.  
The file may  
have been 
mov ed, 
renamed, or  
deleted. 

Verify that  
the link 
points to the  
correct file  
and location. 

  

Customer Care +65 6221 2111 

Claims +65 6221 2199 

Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 

  

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 

Singapore Shopping Centre 

Singapore 

239924                                                                                                                                 

budgetdirect.com.sg 

  

The linked 
image cannot 
be d isplayed.  
The file may  
have been 
mov ed, 
renamed, or  
deleted. 

Verify that  
the link 
points to the  
correct file  
and location. 

  

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget 

Direct Insurance. 

 

 

From: My Car Consultant <admin@mycar.sg> 

Sent: Monday, May 11, 2020 10:29 AM 

To: Stanley Lai <stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Cc: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: SPAM-LOW: Re: OUR REF: SML9408G YOUR REF: SGQ1697K PRE REPAIR INSPECTIONS FOR SML9408G  

  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 

Dear Sirs, 

 

Please appoint LKK for survey  
 
Best Regards, 
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Huiqin 

  

Claims | My Car Consultant Pte Ltd 
   

 

 

+65 88668832 

 

 

Admin@mycar.sg  

 

 

Mycar.sg 

 

 

53 Ubi Ave 1, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, 01-33, S408934
  

 
  
This Email, including attached files, may contain confidential information and is intended only for the use of the individual and/or 
entity to which it is addressed. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender of the error and delete the 
message. Thank you.  
 

From: Stanley Lai <stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Sent: 5/11/20 9:51 AM 
To: "admin@mycar.sg" <admin@mycar.sg> 
Cc: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: SPAM-LOW: Re: OUR REF: SML9408G YOUR REF: SGQ1697K PRE REPAIR INSPECTIONS FOR SML9408G 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

Please find the list of our proposed surveyors.  

  

Mr. Philip Phoong   (A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Muammar Gaddafi Bin Marzuki   (A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd) 

Mr. William Ng   (A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Xing Guo Qiang   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Mohammed Rasul   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Mohamad Taufihk   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Adrian Ling   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Marcus Chua   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Kenneth Kong   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Pang Kiah Keen (Frankie)   (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Chua Soo Teck (Benjamin)   (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Ng You Han   (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd) 
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Mr. Soon HanXin (Gary)   (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Chow Bo Xiong   (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Derrick Quok - our in house surveyor 

  

Kindly let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor 

surveyors. 

 

Regards, 

  

Stanley Lai 

Executive, Claims 

  

T +65 6540 2189 

F +65 6725 0853  

E stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg 

  

  

  

Customer Care +65 6221 2111 

Claims +65 6221 2199 

Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 

  

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 

Singapore Shopping Centre 

Singapore 

239924                                                                                                                                 

budgetdirect.com.sg 
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget 

Direct Insurance. 

 
 

 

From: My Car Consultant <admin@mycar.sg> 
Sent: Saturday, May 9, 2020 1:09 PM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject:OUR REF: SML9408G YOUR REF: SGQ1697K PRE REPAIR INSPECTIONS FOR SML9408G  
  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

OUR REF: SML9408G 

YOUR REF: SGQ1697K 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SML9408G 

  ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML9408G AND SGQ1697K 

 

We refer to the above matter and enclosed herewith our client's GIA report and Notification of Pre-repair 

inspection for your attention. 

 

 We also enclosed herewith the State Court of the Republic of Singapore Practice Direction - Amendment No. 1 of 

2016 of 2016 of Pre-repair Inspection for your attention  
 
Best Regards, 
 

Huiqin 

  

Claims | My Car Consultant Pte Ltd 
   

 

 

+65 88668832 

 

 

Admin@mycar.sg  

 

 

Mycar.sg 

 

 

53 Ubi Ave 1, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, 01-33, S408934
  

 
  
This Email, including attached files, may contain confidential information and is intended only for the use of the individual and/or 
entity to which it is addressed. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender of the error and delete the 
message. Thank you.  
This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited, Easy 
Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed 
in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email 
is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege 
have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended 
addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error 
or virus free. 

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited, 

Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee. 
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The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect 

views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the 

intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure 

of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then 

delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.  


