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Print Sent Message

This mail is associated with :

*SHF655J (C0372759)
[SKL3728X]
TP

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
Feb 17 2016 2:00PM
[SKYWAY MOTOR PTE LTD]
Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 07/12/2017 16:17 PM.
To tan.wancong@axa.com.sg; AXA_SG
cC sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Subject Re: File review- please advise status

Dear Wancong,
Further to the below matter and as discussed earlier.

We had spoken with OI Company incharge Ms Pei Lin and were informed that no update from her
laywer. She will call her lawyer again and will update me.

Since TP repairer also did not chase to settle the matter, we will temporty close the case and will
submit our wp report to your good office.

If there is any further development, we will review the matter.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

<-- Original Message -->
From: AXA_SG

To: LKK_HQ

CC: AXA_SG; sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 28/08/2017 06:14 PM

Subject: File review- please advise status

M redefining /insurance

Hi LKK
File review- please advise status

Thanks
Wancong
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